Exhibit A

EDWARD N.CAHN ATTORNEY SUMMARY APRIL 1, 2010 TO APRIL 30, 2010

	Position of the Professional, Number of Years			
Name of	in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to		Total Billed	Total
Professional	Practice, Area of Expertise	Billing Rate	Hours	Compensation
	Partner Since 1983, Member of PA Bar Since 1972,			
Bachman, A.	Area of Expertise - Employment Benefits & Labor	\$680.00	0.30	\$204.00
	Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981,			
	Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise -			
Fatell, B.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$675.00	41,30	\$27,877.50
	Partner Since 2010, Member of DE Bar Since 1998,			
	Member of PA Bar Since 1998, Area of Expertise -			
Carickhoff, D.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$450.00	0.20	\$90.00
	Partner Since 1991 Member of PA Bar Since 1985,			
Kelbon, R.	Area of Expertise - Bankruptcy	\$600.00	0.3	\$180.00
	Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986,			
Storreo, J.	Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$625.00	0.9	\$562.50
	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005,			, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
Tarr, S.	Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$410.00	15.30	\$6,273.00
	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2009,			
Bee, J	Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$245.00	8.60	\$2,107.00
	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007,			. , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,
Stefanski, J	Area of Expertise - Business	\$275.00	6.10	\$1,677.50
	Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000,			
Casey Spaniel, L	Area of Expertise - Business	\$415.00	34.90	\$14,483.50
Senese, K.	Paralegal (Since 1993)	\$235.00		\$235.00
Moody, T.	Paralegal (Since 1996) \$210.00			
Quigley, J	Law Clerk	\$85.00	0.50	
Grand Total:			117.20	\$55,370.50

EDWARD N.CAHN PROJECT CODE SUMMARY APRIL 1, 2010 TO APRIL 30, 2010

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters	. 0.2	\$135.00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	0.0	\$0.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	2.9	\$1,068.50
4	Debtors' Business Operations	55.6	\$24,172.50
5	Case Administration	. 2.6	\$969.00
6	IP Licensing	19.7	\$12,953.00
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	0,2	\$135.00
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.0	\$0.00
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	0.5	\$339.00
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	26.8	\$12,542.50
12	Stay Relief Issues	0.0	\$0.00
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0.00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	8.7	\$3,056.00
16	Non-Working Travel	0.0	\$0.00
	TOTALS	117.2	\$55,370.50

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 01	•			
Apr 27 10 TELEPHON	E CALL WITH TRUSTEE; T	ELEPHONE CALL	FATELL	0.20
WITH A.	LEWIS REGARDING TRUST	FUNDS		
	·			
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	01	TOTAL VALUE:	\$135.00	0.20

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE	E: 03 REVIEW TANNER RETENTION LETTER FOR 401K AUDIT FOR 2009	FATELL	0.30
Apr 12 10	RESEARCH REGARDING TANNER AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.50
Apr 14 10	PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO TANNER'S 22ND MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	MOODY	0.30
Apr 14 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF CNO FOR TANNER	TARR	0.30
Apr 26 10	ATTEND TO OPA CNO FILING	TARR	0.30
Apr 28 10	REVISE, SCAN AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION RE: MONTHLY APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION (FIFTH) FOR THE PERIOD OF FEBRUARY 1, 2010 THROUGH FEBRUARY 28, 2010 BY OCEAN PARK ADVISORS, LLC	MOODY	0.30
Apr 30 10	EFILE AND SERVE OCEAN PARKS 3RD MONTHLY APPLICATION	MOODY	0.40
Apr 30 10	REVIEW, REVISE AND ATTEND TO FILING OF OPA FEE APPLICATION	TARR	0.50
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 03 TOTAL VALUE;	\$1,068.50	2.90

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CON		FATELL	0.30
Apr 01 10	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH S. TARR AND REVIEW MORS	KELBON	0.30
Apr 01 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS .2; PREPARE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE REGARDING SAME .2	МООДА	0.40
Apr 01 10	DRAFT SUMMARY OF FINANCING ORDER AND CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.80
Apr 02 10	EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH OPA, BLANK ROME TEAM REGARDING MORS AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME (0.5)	TARR	0.50
Apr 05 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL, M. FISLER AND A. NAGLE REGARDING CONDUCT OF AUCTION AND ISSUES TO CONSIDER (.5); PARTICIPATE IN AUCTION (.8); REVIEW AND REVISE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR SALE OF MOBILITY BUSINESS (2.9)	CASEY SPAN	4.20
Apr 05 10	REVIEW OPA SLIDES {0.4}; ATTEND TO AGENDA MATTERS (0.3)	TARR .	0.70
Apr 06 10	ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS	CASEY SPAN	0.80
Apr 06 10	REVIEW SOURCE CODE LICENSE AGREEMENT; REVISE AND EDIT AGREEMENT	stefanski	1.60
Apr 07 10	MEETING WITH OPA AND TRUSTEE AND S. TARR ON STATUS OF RESTRUCTURING AND NEXT STEPS	FATELL	3.80
Apr 07 10	CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING OPTION LANGUAGE IN RELEASE(0.2); REVIEW CHANGES(0.2); EMAIL L. CASEY(0.2)	STORERO	0.60
Apr 07 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS (.7); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.7); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT (1.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH J. STORERO REGARDING RELEASE FOR CLAIMS RELATED TO STOCK OPTIONS (.4); FURTHER REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT AND FOLLOW UP WITH R. TIBBITTS (.6)	CASEY SPAN	3.80
Apr 07 10	MEET WITH OPA REGARDING RESTRUCTURING STRATEGY (4.0)	TARR	4.00

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Apr 08 10	REVIEW REVISED LANGUAGE(0.1); EMAIL L. CASEY(0.1); EMAIL B. FATELL(0.1)	STORERO	0.30
Apr. 08 10	FOLLOW UP WITH R. TIBBITTS AND J. STORERO REGARDING REVISIONS TO STOCK OPTION PROVISIONS IN AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY ASSETS (1.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.3); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (1.3)	CASEY SPAN	2.80
Apr 09 10	REVIEW B. FATELL'S REVISIONS TO PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS AND REVISE AGREEMENT (.4); FINALIZE AGREEMENT AND DISTRIBUTE TO PURCHASER (.4)	CASEY SPAN	0.80
Apr 12 10	REVIEW DRAFT LETTER TO THE OPEN GROUP AND COMMENT	FATELL	0.20
Apr 12 10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE FROM M. FISLER REGARDING RESPONSE TO THE OPEN GROUP, REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES AND FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER (.6); REVIEW ADDITIONAL TERMS FOR MOBILITY SALE FROM A. NAGLE (.2); TELEPHONE CONPERENCE WITH A. NAGLE REGARDING BACKGROUND FOR ADDITIONAL TERMS (.3); FINALIZE REVISIONS TO REVISED DRAFT (.5); FOLLOW UF WITH B. FATELL REGARDING REMAINING ISSUES (.2)	Casey span	1.80
Apr 12 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SIDE LETTER OR LICENSE AGREEMENT FOR PATCHCK SOURCE CODE	STEFANSKI	0,20
Apr 13 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO TRUSTEE	FATELL	0.10
Apr 13 10	REVIEW LETTER TO THE OPEN GROUP	FATELL	0.10
Apr 13 10	REVIEW MCBRIDE'S REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH . FATELL AND M. FISLER REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.6); DRAFT FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. TIBBITTS REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.3); REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH B. FATELL AND J. BEE REGARDING ESCROW FOR COMPETING BIDDER (.4); FINALIZE REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (1.2)	CASEY SPAN	3,40
Apr 13 10	DRAFT AND REVISE AND EDIT PATCHCK SOURCE CODE LICENSE; EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO L. CASEY REGARDING SAME	STEFANSKI	1.10
Apr 14 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING WINDOW OF VARIOUS FOREIGN SUBSIDIARIES	PATELL	0,80
Apr 14 10	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM L. CASEY	STEFANSKI	0.60

DATE

Apr 16 10

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER HOURS

0.20

3.80

CASEY SPAN

CASEY SPAN

3.70

REGARDING REVISED SCO-MCBRIDE APA(0.1); REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM A. NAGLE REGARDING CHANGES TO ATTACHMENTS (0.1); REVISE AND EDIT SPA(0.3); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING REVISED APA(0.1)

REVIEW REVISIONS AND COMMENTS TO PURCHASE Apr 15 10 AGREEMENT (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. AGREEMENT (.6); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR ME INC. REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN PURCHASE AGREEMENT (. 9); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. NAGLE REGARDING ADDITIONAL TERMS FOR PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.3); FINALIZE

CASEY SPAN NAGLE AND M. FISLER REGARDING ISSUES IN REVISED REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (1.8)

OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING STEFANSKI Apr 15 10 LICENSING RELATIONSHIP WITH GENISYS AND AMENDMENTS TO APA

SEVERAL CALLS WITH M. FISLER AND B. COMER ON FATELL 0.50 Apr 16 10 RESTRUCTURING

Apr 16 10 TELECONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING FATELL 0.40

Apr 16 10 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR ME INC REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND M. FISLER REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN AGREEMENT (.5); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR ME INC REGARDING ADDITIONAL REVISIONS (.6); FOLLOW UP WITH R. TIBBITTS (.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR

RELATIONSHIP AND MODIFIED ASSET LIST

INVESTORS TO ME INC (.3) STEFANSKI 1.20 REVISE AND EDIT APA REGARDING GENISYS

REVIEW REVISIONS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT BY CASEY SPAN 4.70 Apr 19 10 COUNSEL FOR ME INC (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. NAGLE AND M. FISLER REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN AGREEMENT (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH COUNSEL FOR INVESTORS FOR ME INC (.7); ADDITIONAL REVISIONS TO AGREEMENT AND FOLLOW UP WITH COUNSEL FOR ME INC (2.7)

Apr 20 10 REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND PROPOSED AGREEMENT WITH GENISYS AND FOLLOW UP WITH A. NAGLE (.7); REVIEW OUTSTANDING ISSUES RAISED BY COUNSEL FOR INVESTORS FOR ME INC AND DRAFT RESPONSES (1.3); FINALIZE SIGNATURE COPIES OF

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	AGREEMENT (1.7)		
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. COMER REGARDING OPERATIONS	FATELL	0.30
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B, COMER REGARDING RESTRUCTURING	FATELL	0.30
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN REGARDING EXECUTION OF PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING EXECUTED AGREEMENT (.4)	CASEY SPAN	0.70
Apr 26 10	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM CLIENT AND VMWARE LICENSE AGREEMENT AND OUTLINE CHANGES TO BE MADE	stefanski	0.30
Apr 27 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING VMWARE AGREEMENT AND CHANGES TO BE MADE	stefanski	0.10
Apr 28 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING THE OPEN GROUP CONTRACT	FATELL	0.10
Apr 28 10	REVISE AND EDIT VMWARE AGREEMENT; DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO CLIENT REGARDING SAME; REVISE AND EDIT EMAIL	STEFANSKI	0.80
Apr 30 10	EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING OPERATIONS	FATELL	0.10
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 04 TOTAL VALUE: \$	24,172.50	55.60

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	DE: 05			
Apr 05 10	REVIEW HEARING AGENDA		FATELL	0.20
Apr 05 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET AND PLEAD! CORRESPOND WITH S. TARR REGARDIN FEE HEARING	·	MOODY	0,30
Apr 07 10	PREPARE AND SUBMIT 3/15/10 HEAR! REQUEST	ING TRANSCRIPT	MOODY	0.30
Apr 12 10	REVIEW EMAIL AND DRAFT LETTER TO REGARDING ETRADE) EMPLOYEES	FATELI,	0.20
Apr 12 10	REVIEW, SORT AND ORGANIZE PLEAD	ings	MOODY	0.20
Apr 16 10	EMAIL REGARDING OMNIBUS HEARING	DATES	FATELL	0.10
Apr 16 10	PREPARE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL OMNIBUS HEARING DATES	L REGARDING	MOODY	0.20
Apr 16 10	CONFERENCE WITH CHAMBERS REGARD: HEARING DATES AND ATTEND TO FIL: CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARD: REVIEW AGENDA REGARDING 4/20/10	ING SAME (0.4);	TARR	0.60
Apr 20 10	UPDATE 2002 SERVICE LIST AND REI IN LIGHT OF RECENTLY FILED REQUI OF PAPERS		senese	0.10
Apr 29 10	EMAILS REGARDING THE OPEN GROUP		FATELL	0.20
Apr 29 10	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO RVB TO REGARDING OBTAINING COPIES	BCH, INC.	Onigrea	0.20
PROJECT CO	DE TOTALS 05	TOTAL VALUE:	\$969.00	2.60

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	DE: 06 LITIGATION TEAM CALL AND FOLLOW UP WITH S. TARR	FATELL	1.10
Apr 01 10	REVIEW DETAILED REPORT FROM R. TIBBITTS ON TRIAL SUMMARY	FATELL	0.20
Apr 01 10	ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING POST-NOVELL TRIAL STATUS	TARR	1.00
Apr 02 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING NEXT STEP	FATELL	0.60
Apr 02 10	EMAIL LITIGATION TEAM REGARDING FINDINGS OF FACT	FATELL	0.20
Apr 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. LEWIS AND NOTES TO FILE	FATELL	0.30
Apr 14 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING STATUS OF LITIGATION	FATELL	0.30
Apr 14 10	EMAILS REGARDING TRIAL AND PENDING MOTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Apr,15 10	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT FINDINGS OF FACT	FATELL	4.80
Apr 16 10	FURTHER REVIEW AND REVISE FINDINGS OF FACT AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW	FATELL	4.60
Apr 16 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY AND R. TIBBITTS (.2); AND K. MCBRIDE (.2) TO FINALIZE APA FOR MOBILITY	FATELL	0,40
Apr 16 10	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING FINDINGS AND CONCLUSIONS OF LAW	FATELL	0.40
Apr 19 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. LEWIS REGARDING ESCROW FUNDS	FATELL	0.10
Apr 19 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS; REVIEW EDITS REGARDING FINDINGS OF FACT AND MEMO OF LAW	FATELL	0.80
Apr 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING NOVELL CLAIMS	FATELL	0.20
Apr 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING MOBILITY APA	PATELL	0.20
Apr 20 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING NOVELL CLAIM TO ESCROWED FUNDS AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0,30
Apr 20 10	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING CONSTRUCTIVE TRUST FUNDS AND EMAIL TO A, LEWIS (1.1); TELECONFERENCE WITH A, LEWIS REGARDING SAME (.2)	FATELL	1.30

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. JACOBS REGARDING POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. CAHN REGARDING SETTLEMENT STRATEGY (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. CAHN AND R. TIBBITTS (.3)	FATELL	0.50
Apr 21 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SINGER REGARDING SETTLEMENT STRATEGY	FATELL	0.30
Apr 21 10	RESEARCH NOVELL ISSUE AND EMAIL SCO LITIGATION TEAM REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.30
Apr 26 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH LITIGATION TEAM REGARDING POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.90
Apr 28 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. JACOBS AND TRUSTEE REGARDING POTENTIAL SETTLEMENT WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.20
Apr 30 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SINGER REGARDING DISCUSSIONS WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.20
PROJECT COL	DE TOTALS 06 TOTAL VALUE:	\$12,953.00	19.70

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER HOURS	
PROJECT CO	DE: 07		
Apr 14 10	REVIEW IC AGREEMENT WITH FORMER EM	PLOYEE AND FATELL 0.20	ı
	EMAIL B. COMER		
PROJECT CO	DE TOTALS 07 TO	TAL VALUE: \$135.00 0.20)

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER I	HOURS
PROJECT CODE				
Apr 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. BA EMPLOYEE 101K PLAN	CHMAN REGARDING	FATELL	0.20
Apr 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL FROM B. FA LETTER FROM ACCOUNTANT	TELL; REVIEW MEMOS AND	BACHMAN	0.30
		,		
PROJECT CODE	E TOTALS 09	TOTAL VALUE:	\$339.00	0.50

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL Apr 01 10		FATELL	0.70
Apr 01 10	EMAILS REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENTS WITH OCEAN PARK ADVISORS; REVIEW ESCROW AGREEMENTS	BEE	0.20
Apr 01 10	RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING DE MINIMIS ASSET SALE ORDER	TARR	0.30
Apr 02 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING MOBILITY SALE (.3); EMAIL L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (.1)	FATELL	. 0.40
Apr 02 10	REVIEW J. BEE EMAILS REGARDING ESCROW AGREEMENT IN CONNECTION WITH IP SALE	TARR	0.30
Apr 02 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY AUCTION (0.3)	TARR	0.30
Apr 05 10	REVIEW PLEADINGS REGARDING MOBILITY SALE, DETAILED EMAILS, REVISED ASSET LIST AND PREPARE FOR AUCTION	FATELL	1.20
Apr 05 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH A. NAGLE AND M. FISLER TO PREFARE FOR AUCTION	FATELL	0.60
Apr 05 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING AUCTION	FATELL	0.20
Apr 05.10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CASEY, A. NAGLE AND M. FISLER REGARDING AUCTION	FATELL	0.40
Apr 05 10	ATTEND AUCTION	FATELL	0.80
Apr 05 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER (.2); TELEPHONE CALL WITH L. CASEY REGARDING FINALIZING THE ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.1)	FATELL,	0.30
Apr 05 10	PARTICIPATE IN AUCTION, REVIEW REVISIONS FROM BIS TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT; REVIEW REVISED ASSET LIST	FATELL	1.20
Apr 05 10	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING LIST OF ASSETS FOR MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.20
Apr 06 10	MULTIPLE DETAILED EMAILS AND REVIEW ATTACHMENTS REGARDING PREPARATION OF TRUSTEE INTERIM REPORT	FATELL	0.50
Apr 06 10	DISCUSS TRUSTEE'S DRAFT INTERIM REPORT	FATELL	0.50
Apr 06 10	REVIEW CORRESPONDENCE RECEIVED FROM THE PATENT PLACE, INC. REGARDING THE SCO GROUP; PREPARE DOCUMENTATION FOR SAME	Onigrea	0.10
Apr 06 10	CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING 4/7/10	TARR	0.30

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	HEARING		
Apr 07 10	PREPARE CORRESPONDENCE TO THE PATENT PLACE REGARDING THE PATENT	G OIGTEA	0.20
Apr 09 10	MONITOR EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SALE OF MOBILITY	FATELL	0.30
Apr 12 10	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY BUSINESS SALE; DISCUSS WITH L. CASEY	FATELL	0.30
Apr 12 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R, NEILL AT HEWLETT PACKARD REGARDING TRANSFER OF IP	FATELL	0.20
Apr 13 10	REVIEW PROPOSED CHANGES TO ASSET FURCHASE AGREEMENT ON MOBILITY AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.70
Apr 13 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER AND B. COMER REGARDING SALE PROCESS	FATELL	0.40
Apr 13 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH . CASEY, M. FISLER AND A. NEGLE REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.60
Apr 13 10	EMAILS REGARDING BIS DEPOSIT FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS	FATELL	0.10
Apr 13 10	EMAILS REGARDING STATUS OF ESCROW AGREEMENTS FOR SALE OF MOBILITY BUSINESS	BEE	0.30
Apr 13 10	RESEARCH AND ATTEND TO ESCROW ISSUES (0.6); REVIEW NUMEROUS EMAILS REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	1.00
Apr 14 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SALE OF ASSETS	FATELL	0.30
Apr 14 10	REVIEW FURTHER REVISIONS TO MOBILITY SALE AGREEMENT	FATELL	0.30
Apr 14 10	REVIEW NDA FOR PROSPECTIVE PURCHASER OF PATENT AND COMMENTS	FATELL	0.30
Apr 15 10	EMAIL TO M. FISLER REGARDING NDA TO PROPSECTIVE BIDDER ON PATENT	PATELL	0.20
Apr 16 10	REVIEW AND APPROVE AGENDA; DISCUSS PATENT SALE WITH M. FISLER	FATELL	0.30
Apr 16 10	TELECONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SALE ISSUES AND EVIDENCE IN SUPPORT OF SAME	CARICKHOFF	0.20
Apr 19 10	SCAN PROPOSED CHANGES TO ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FOR MOBILITY	FATELI.	0,30

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Apr 19 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. TARR REGARDING FILING CNO FOR PATENT SALE MOTION	FATELL	0.10
Apr 19 10	REVIEW DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION AND PROPOSED ORDER APPROVING MOTION TO SELL IP ASSETS; EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH S. TARR REGARDING EXHIBIT DOCUMENTATION FOR PROPOSED ORDER; REVIEW REVISED PLEADINGS; FORMAT AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION AN D PROPOSED ORDER, WITH EXHIBIT	SENESE	0.40
Apr 19 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF CNO REGARDING IP ASSET SALE	TARR	0.50
Apr 20 10	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING MOBILITY SALE	FATELL	0.60
Apr 20 10	COORDINATE EXECUTION OF PATENT ASSIGNMENT AND RELEASE OF ESCROW FUNDS AND PAYMENT TO THE SCO GROUP, INC. (.8); PHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH OCEAN PARK ADVISORS, C. DONNELLY, B. FATELL REGARDING CLOSING ACTIONS FOR SALE OF IP ASSET (.2)	BEE	1.00
Apr 20 10	CONFER WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING 4/20 HEARING AND EMAILS WITH BLANK ROME TEAM REGARDING SAME (0.4); EMAILS AND CONFERENCES WITH OPA REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	0.80
Apr 21 10	COORDINATE TRANSFER OF DEPOSIT FROM L TO THE SCO GROUP, INC. FROM ESCROW ACCOUNT(1.1); COORDINATE TRANSFER OF DEPOSIT FROM BACK TO BOOK FROM ESCROW ACCOUNT(1.0)	REOX	2.10 ICTED
Apr 22 10	COORDINATE TRANSFER OF DEPOSIT FROM L	RED	0.70 ACTED
Apr 23 10	COORDINATE TRANSFER OF DEPOSIT FROM TO THE SCO GROUP, INC. FROM ESCROW ACCOUNT(0.7); COORDINATE TRANSFER OF DEPOSIT FROM BACK TO FROM ESCROW ACCOUNT(0.2)	BEE RE	0.90 DACTED
Apr 26 10	DRAFT NOTICE OF COMPLETED SALE FOR SALE OF IP	BEE	0.30
Apr 27 10	CONFIRM RECEIPT OF ALL PAYMENTS TO SCO FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS AND IP ASSET (.2); REVIEW	BEE	3.10

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	EXECUTED ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT FROM SAL MOBILITY BUSINESS AND EXECUTED PATENT ASSIGNMENT FROM SALE OF IP ASSET (.4); REV NOTICE OF COMPLETED SALE FOR IP ASSET; DRA AND REVISE NOTICE OF COMPLETED SALE FOR MOBILITY BUSINESS (2.5)	ISE	
Apr 29 10	RESEARCH AND DRAFT NOTICE OF DE MINIMIS AS SALE AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	set tarr	0.50
Apr 30 10	REVIEW REPORT ON DIMINIMIS SALES	FATELL	0.20
Apr 30 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE FIRST QUARTERLY REPO DE MINIMIS ASSET SALES CONSUMMATED BY THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE	RT OF MOODY	0.50
Apr 30 10	CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING FILING OF MINIMIS SALE NOTICE (0.2) AND ATTEND TO FI OF SAME (0.4)		0.60
PROJECT COL	E TOTALS 11 TOTAL VALU	E: \$12,542.50	26.80

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COE Apr 05 10		RVE 4/7/10	МООДУ	2,50
Apr 05 10	PREPARE AND REVISE 4/7/10 AMENDED	D AGENDA	MOODY	0.50
Apr 07 10	PREPARE FOR HEARING INCLUDING PRIPAREST PROFILE, REVIEW ORDER, DRAFT PRESCOURT		FATELL	1.30
Apr 07 10	ATTEND HEARING ON SALE OF MOBILITY	IY AND	FATELL	0.80
Apr 07 10	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND HEARING		TARR	1.20
Apr 15 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PREPARE, REVISE AND CIRCULATE TO 4/20/10 AGENDA	-	MOODY	0.60
Apr 16 10	PREPARE, FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AS HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS REGARD AGENDA AND NOTEBOOKS		моору	0.80
Apr 16 10	PREPARE AND FINALIZE SERVICE OF .3; PREPARE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE		MOODY	0.50
Apr 20 10	EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH S. TARR (0.1) AMENDED AGENDA NOTICING TODAY'S I BEING CANCELLED (0.2); FORMAT AND AGENDA (0.1); SERVICE OF SAME UPON PARTIES (0.1)	HEARING IS EFILE AMENDED	Senese	0.50
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 15 TOTAL VALUE:		\$3,056.00	8,70	

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

REPORT TOTALS

TOTAL VALUE:

55,370.50

117.20

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS