## Exhibit A

## EDWARD N.CAHN ATTORNEY SUMMARY MAY 1, 2010 TO MAY 31, 2010

Professional	Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
	Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981,			
	Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise -			
Fatell, B.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$675.00	10.40	\$7,020.00
	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005,			
Tarr, S.	Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$410.00	8.70	\$3,567.00
	Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000,			
Casey Spaniel, L	Area of Expertise - Business	\$415.00	2.50	\$1,037.50
Moody, T.	Paralegal (Since 1996)	\$210.00	11.50	\$2,415.00
Grand Total:			33.10	\$14,039.50

## EDWARD N.CAHN PROJECT CODE SUMMARY MAY 1, 2010 TO MAY 31, 2010

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter II Trustee Specific Matters	0.0	\$0,00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	14.6	\$3,986.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	1.4	\$494.00
4	Debtors' Business Operations	12.6	\$7,172.00
5	Case Administration	0,0	\$0.00
6	IP Licensing	3.3	\$1,936.00
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	0.0	\$0.00
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.0	\$0.00
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	0.0	\$0.00
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	0.6	\$325.50
12	Stay Relief Issues	0.0	\$0.00
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0.00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	0.6	\$126.00
16	Non-Working Travel	0.0	\$0.00
	TOTALS	33.1	\$14,039.50

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 02 EMAIL T. MOODY, K. BUCHANAN REGARI (0.3)	DING FEE APPS	TARR	0.30
May 19 10	REVIEW AND EDIT BILLING PETITION I	FOR JANUARY	MOODY	1.00
May 21 10	REVIEW AND EDIT PRO FORMA		MOODY	4.20
May 24 10	REVIEW AND EDIT PROFORMA		MOODY	0.90
May 27 10	REVIEW AND EDIT MONTHLY BILLS		моорх	3,90
May 27 10	PREPARE FEE APPLICATION AND CONFE	R WITH T.	TARR	2.30
May 28 10	PREPARE BR FEE APPLICATION AND COMMOODY, K. BUCHANAN REGARDING SAME	NFER WITH T.	TARR	2.00
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 02 TO	OTAL VALUE:	\$3,986.00	14.60

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	E; 03			
May 28 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE OPA'S	TH MONTHLY	MOODY	0.40
	APPLICATION			
May 28 10	REVIEW OPA FEE APPLICATION AN (0.5); PREPARE CNO AND ATTENI	TO FILING OF	TARR	1,00
ውያስ.ፕኖርሞ <i>ር</i> ሰና	SAME, INCLUDING CONFERENCE WI	TOTAL VALUE:	\$494.00	1.40

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	DE: 04		
	STATUS REPORT ON RESTRUCTURING FROM OPA	FATELL	1.00
May 04 10	EMAILS REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	FATELL	0.10
May 04 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORT	S MOODY	0.50
May 04 10	ATTEND TO FILING OF MORS	TARR	0.50
May 06 10	M. FISLER REGARDING OPERATIONS	FATELL	0.20
May 06 10	FINALIZE REVISIONS TO TERMS WITH VM WARE (.6); DRAFT FOLLOW UP EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO A. NAGLE REGARDING REVISIONS TO TERMS (.3)	Casey Span	0.90
Мау 06 10	ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH OPA, B. FATELL, E. CAHN	TARR	0.30
May 07 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH OPA REGARDING PENDING OPERATING ISSUES	FATELL	0.30
Мау 10 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH OPA AND TRUSTEE ON STATUS OP VARIOUS PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	1.20
May 10 10	CONFER WITH CHAMBERS REGARDING 5/17 HEARING DATE AND EMAIL T. MOODY, B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.3); REVIEW DRAFT NOTICE AND EMAIL J. BEE REGARDING SAME (0.3)	TARR	0.60
May 11 10	CONFER WITH J. BEE REGARDING NOTICE	TARR	0.30
May 19 10	MEETING WITH OPA AND TRUSTEE FOR PART OF TIME REGARDING RESTRUCTURING	FATELL	1,.00
Мау 19 10	CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS AND OPA REGARDING ASSET SALE	fatell	1.00
May 19 10	REVIEW OPA MATERIALS	<b>FATELL</b>	0.30
May 19 10	FURTHER MEETING WITH OPA INCLUDING MEETING WIT L. CASEY AND CONFERENCE WITH A. NAGLE REGARDIN RESTRUCTURING, ASSET SALE		2,80
May 19 10	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL, M. FISLER AND B. COMER REGARDING STRATEGIES FOR ASSETS OF COMPANY (.8); REVIEW PREVIOUS ANALYSIS OF ASSIGNMENT OF LICENSES AND PREVIOUS AGREEMENTS WITH NOVELL (.8)		1.60
PROJECT CO	DE TOTALS 04 TOTAL VALUE:	\$7,172.00	12.60

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 06		
May 04 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. JACOBS REGARDING	FATELL	0.20
	SETTLEMENT		
May 04 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH H. JACKSON REGARDING	FATELL	0.30
	THEORIES TO PURSUE		
May 04 10	CONFERENCE WITH LITIGATION TEAM REGARDING	FATELL	0.30
	POSSIBLE SETTLEMENT		
May 04 10	EMAIL TO R. TIBBITTS REGARDING NOVELL CLA	ims fatell	0.10
W 05 10	MOVED THE STATE OF	FATELL	0.10
may 06 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. JACOBS REGARDING SETTLEMENT	FALEDO	0.10
May 06 10	EMAIL OPA REGARDING LITIGATION ITEMS AND ANALYSIS OF THE SAME (1.1)	TARR	1.10
May 20 10	REVIEW LICENSE POLICY AND REVISE	FATELL	0.40
May 26 10	REVIEW AND EDIT STIPULATION WITH NOVELL	FATELL	0.30
May 26 10	DETAILED EMAIL TO R. TIBEITTS REGARDING N	OVELL PATELY	0.30
	TRUST FUNDS (.2); FOLLOW UP EMAILS (.1)		
May 27 10	EMAIL REGARDING STIPULATION WITH NOVELL T	vo patri.i.	0.20
nay ar 10	RELEASE TRUST FUNDS		V.4V
	DD MODEL I OF MOMENT 175 Y	.UE: \$1,936.00	3.30
PROJECT COL	DE TOTALS 06 TOTAL VAI	IOE: \$1,330.00	3.30

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 11		
May 05 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING TRADEMARK AND	DE FATELL	0.10
	MINIMUS SALE PROCESS		
May 05 10	EMAILS WITH M. HAKIM RE TRADEMARK SALE (0.3)	TARR	0.30
May 26 10	REVIEW DETAILED EMAIL FROM B. COMER REGARDING	FATELL	0.20
	IC AGREEMENTS		
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 11 TOTAL VALUE:	\$325.50	0.60

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	Hours
PROJECT COE	E: 15 REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEE HEARING CANCELATION FOR 5/		MOODY .	0.40
May 12 10	FINALIZE, EFILE AND SERVE CANCELLATION FOR 5/17/10	NOTICE OF HEARING	МООДУ	0.20
PROJECT COL	E TOTALS 15	TOTAL VALUE:	\$126,00	0.60

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS

REPORT TOTALS

TOTAL VALUE:

14,039.50

33.10

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS