Exhibit A

EDWARD N.CAHN ATTORNEY SUMMARY JUNE 1, 2010 TO JUNE 30, 2010

Name of Professional	Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
БТ	Partner Since 1999, Member of PA Bar Since 1987,	\$550.00	0.30	\$165.00
Pecsenye, T	Area of Expertise - Employment Benefits & Labor Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981,	\$330.00	0.30	\$105.00
·	Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise -			
Fatell, B.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$675,00	11.60	\$7,830.00
Kelbon, R.	Partner Since 1991 Member of PA Bar Since 1985, Area of Expertise - Bankruptcy	\$600.00	0.9	\$540.00
Storreo, J.	Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986, Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$625,00	1.6	\$1,000.00
Tarr, S.	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$410.00	1.90	\$779.00
Bee, J	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2009, Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$245.00	4.70	\$1,151 .50
Stefanski, J	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007, Area of Expertise - Business	\$275.00	13.10	\$3,602.50
Can su Enomial I	Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000,	\$415.00	11.10	\$4,606.50
Casey Spaniel, L Moody, T.	Area of Expertise - Business Paralegal (Since 1996)	\$210.00		
Grand Total:	, a.ay \		57.10	<u> </u>

EDWARD N.CAHN PROJECT CODE SUMMARY JUNE 1, 2010 TO JUNE 30, 2010

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters	2.0	\$1,270.00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	9.8	\$2,238.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	0.6	\$146.00
4	Debtors' Business Operations	32.6	\$11,315.00
5	Case Administration	1.9	\$944.00
6	IP Licensing	7.8	\$5,065.50
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	0.0	\$0.00
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.0	\$0.00
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	0.0	\$0.00
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	1.6	\$1,027.00
12	Stay Relief Issues	0.0	\$0.00
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0,00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	0.8	\$168.00
16	Non-Working Travel	0.0	\$0.00
	TOTALS	57.1	\$22,173.50

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 01		
Jun 14 10	TELEPHONE CALL TO R. TIBBITTS (.2); TELEPHONE CALL TO FIDELITY INVESTMENTS (.1); E-MAIL TO FATELL (.2)		0.50
Jun 15 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON (.1); LOCATE DOCUMENTS (.2)	STORERO	0.30
Jun 16 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH FIDELITY (.3); E-MAILS R. TIBBITTS AND B. FATELL (.2); REVI E-MAIL (.1)		0.60
Jun 17 10	TELEPHONE CALL TO FIDELITY REPRESENTATIVE	STORERO	0.20
Jun 18 10	REVIEW AND APPROVE FOR FILING DECEMBER FEE APPLICATION	FATELL	0.40
PROJECT COL	DE TOTALS 01 TOTAL VALUE;	\$1,270.00	2.00

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 02			
Jun 04 10	EMAIL T. MOODY REGARDING FEE APP	LICATION	TARR	0.10
Jun 08 10	RESPOND TO V. BHAT REGARDING INVO	OICES	TARR	0.40
Jun 09 10	EMAILS WITH B, FATELL REGARDING APPLICATIONS	FÉE	TARR	0.20
Jun 10 10	EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING FEE AP	PLICATION	TARR	0.20
Jun 18 10	UPDATE 3RD MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	ON	MOODY	0,40
Jun 18 10	FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE APPLICATION	3RD MONTHLY	YDOOM	1.30
Jun 21 10	REVISE 4TH COMBINED MONTHLY APPL	ICATION	MOODY	1,50
Jun 21 10	REVISE 4TH COMBINED MONTHLY APPL	ICATION	моору	1.00
Jun 22 10	FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY APPLICATION	4TH COMBINED	MOODY	0.90
Jun 23 10	PREPARE INTERIM FEE APPLICATION		MOODY	0.30
Jun 24 10	PREPARE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLIC	ATION	MOODY	1,10
Jun 24 10	PREPARE FIRST INTERIM FEE APPLIC	NOITA	MOODY	0.80
Jun 24 10	PREPARE FIRST INTERIM APPLICATIO	N	MOODY	0.60
Jun 25 10	FINALIZE 1ST INTERIM APPLICATION SAME TO B. FATELL FOR REVIEW	PAPERS; EMAIL	MOODA	1.00
PROJECT COL	E TOTALS 02	TOTAL VALUE:	\$2,238.00	9.80

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 03				
Jun 17 10 EMAIL V.	BHAT REGARDING INTERIM	FEE APPLICATION	TARR	0.10
Jun 23 10 RESEARCH	FEE APPLICATION STATUS	OF VARIOUS	MOODY	0.50
PROFESSIO	SLANC		•	
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	03	TOTAL VALUE:	\$146.00	0.60

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER (HOURS
PROJECT COD.		casey span	
Jun 02 10	RESEARCH SOFTWARE COPYRIGHTS AND (1.2); BEGIN DRAFT REPORTING EMAIL REGARDING FINDINGS (.7)	STEPANSKI REDAC	
Jun 02 10	READ PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACTS AND OUTLINE RELEVANT PROVISIONS REGARDING	stefanski REDA (
Jun 03 10	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. COMER REGARDING JAPAN SUBSIDIARY	FATELL	0.50
Jun 03 10	REVIEW RESEARCH REGARDING . IN SOFTWARE CONTEXT; REVISE AND EDIT REPORTING EMAIL REGARDING SAME AND SEND TO L. CASEY; COMPLETE REVIEW OF PROPOSED FINDINGS OF FACT; OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING RESEARCH AND FINDINGS OF FACT	stefanski REOA	
Jun 04 10	FINALIZE CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATION OF PAYMENT OF TRUST FUND TO NOVELL	MOODX	0.30
Jun 04 10	FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AND COORDINATE HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS REGARDING CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATION FOR PAYMENT OF TRUST FUND TO NOVELL	MOODY	0.40
Jun 07 10	REVIEW BACKGROUND MATERIALS; FOLLOW UP WITH B. FATELL REGARDING TRANSFER ISSUES	CASEY SPAN	1.70
Jun 07 10	COMPLETE REVIEW OF FINDINGS OF FACT	Stefanski	0.30
Jun 08 10	PREPARE LETTER TO TEAM 1 SYSTEMS REGARDING UNPAID INVOICES (1.0); PHONE CALL WITH M. HAKIM REGARDING PREPARATION OF LETTER TO TEAM 1 SYSTEMS (.1)	BEE	1.10
Jun 09 10	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. NIELSEN AND OTHER REGARDING OPERATIONS	FATELL	0.20
Jun 09 10	RESEARCH REGARDING TERMS OF CASES CITED IN NOVELL'S LETTER CORRESPONDENCE	stefanski REOA	
Jun 10 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS; EMAIL TO B. FATELL ATTACHING AGREED ORDER APPROVING STIPULATION FOR PAYMENT OF TRUST FUND TO NOVELL	MOODY	0.20
Jun 11 10	WEEKLY CONFERENCE CALL WITH TRUSTEE AND OPA	FATELL	1.20

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jun 11 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING D&O INSURANCE	fatell.	0.10
Jun 11 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING D & O INSURANCE	KELBON	0.10
Jun 14 10	CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY SPANIEL REGARDING IP ISSUES IN BANKRUPTCY	PECSENYE	0.30
Jun 14 10	REVIEW RESEARCH ON .: ISSUES (CEDACTED	CASEY SPAN	2.20
Jun 15 10	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF BACKGROUND AGREEMENTS AND RESEARCH ON ISSUES (2.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH LEGAL TEAM REGARDING STRATEGIES FOR BUSINESS (1.)		3.80
Jun 15 10	REVIEW COURT'S FINDINGS OF FACT; RESEARCH REGARDING TERMS	stefanski T&O	1.90
Jun 15 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING RESEARCH FINDINGS	stefanski	. 0.30
Jun 15 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH L. CASEY AND CLIENT REGARDING COURT'S RULING AND MOVING FORWARD WITH LITIGATION	STEFANSKI	1.00
Jun 16 10	REVIEW NOVELL ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND COURT DECISION; CONFERENCE WITH J STEFANSKI REGARDING 1. ISSUES		2.20
Jun 16 10	REVIEW NOVELL ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	STEFANSKI	0.90
Jun 16 10	OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L, CASEY REGARDING TERMS OF NOVELL ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT	stefanski	0.20
Jun 16 10	PURCHASE AGREEMENT AND REVISE AND EDIT EMAIL AND SUBMIT TO L. CASEY		0.70
Jun 16 10	DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO TEAM 1 SYSTEMS REGARDING UNPAID INVOICES	BEE	2.60
Jun 17 10	DRAFT DEMAND LETTER TO TEAM 1 SYSTEMS REGARDING UNPAID INVOICES	BEE	0.70
Jun 21 10	EMAIL REGARDING D&O INSURANCE	FATELL	0.10
Jun 21 10	EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING STATUS OF DEMAND LETTER TO TEAM 1 SYSTEMS	BEE	0.10
Jun 23 10	RESPOND TO T. MOODY EMAIL REGARDING FINANCING AGREEMENT	TARR	0.30

PROJECT CODE TOTALS 04

TIMEKEEPER HOURS DATE NARRATIVE Jun 28 10 EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING TEAM 1 SYSTEMS BEE 0.20 BANKRUPTCY FILING AND DEMAND LETTERS TO XILINK AND MEMOSIS SISTEMAS TOTAL VALUE: \$11,315.00 32,60

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	DE: 05			
Jun 04 10	EMAILS WITH J. BEE, B. FATELL I	REGARDING TEAM 1	TARR	0.30
Jun 07 10	ATTENTION TO FILING		MOODY	0.30
Jun 07 10	RESPOND TO M. HAKIM REGARDING	ГЕАМ 1	TARR	0.20
Jun 15 10	LEGAL TEAM MEETING REGARDING OF	PTIONS AFTER JURY	FATELL	1.00
Jun 28 10	UPDATE 2002 SERVICE INFORMATION	4	MOODY	0.20
PROJECT CON	DE TOTALS 05	TOTAL VALUE:	\$944.00	1.90

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CON		FATELL	0.20
Jun 10 10	SCAN/REVIEW FINDINGS OF FACT, CONCLUSIONS OF LAW AND MEMORANDUM OPINION	FATELL	0.80
Jun 10 10	EMAILS REGARDING RELEASE FUNDS TO NOVELL	FATELL	0.10
Jun 10 10	EMAIL TRUSTEE AND L. CASEY	FATELL	0.10
Jun 11 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. SINGER REGARDING COURT ORDER	FATELL	0.10
Jun 11 10	EMAIL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING COURT RULING	FATELL	0.10
Jun 14 10	EMAILS REGARDING IMPACT OF NOVELL DECISION AND TELEPHONE OPA REGARDING SAME	PATELL	0.20
Jun 14 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING COURT DECISION AND IP ISSUES	FATELL	0.20
Jun 15 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. LEWIS REGARDING NEXT STEP	FATELL	0.10
Jun 15 10	EMAILS REGARDING SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE	FATELL	0.20
Jun 15 10	REVIEW FILES FOR CORPORATE DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL EXCHANGES WITH L. CASEY	KELBON	0.80
Jun 15 10	RESEARCH FILES FOR R. KELBON TO LOCATE CERTAIN IP DOCUMENTS	MOODY	0.30
Jun 17 10	EMAIL R. TIBBITTS REGARDING LENDER CALL (.1); EMAIL WITH A. LEWIS AND S. SINGER REGARDING CONFERENCE CALL ON LITIGATION (.1)	FATELL	0.20
Jun 18 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING CALL WITH LENDERS REGARDING LITIGATION	FATELL	0.10
Jun 18 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH LENDERS REGARDING LITIGATION	FATELL	0.80
Jun 22 10	REVIEW CONFIDENTIAL MEMO ON	FATELL	0.20
Jun 22 10	REVIEW SALE TEASER	FATELL	0.30
Jun 22 10	PARTICIPATE IN LITIGATION TEAM CONFERENCE CALL	FATELL	0.60
Jun 22 10	SET UP MEETINGS WITH NOVELL AND LITIGATION TEAM	FATELL	0.20
Jun 22 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER AND M. FISLER REGARDING TEASER, DUE DILIGENCE FOR SALE AND OTHER OPERATIONAL ISSUES	FATELL	0.60

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
<i>J</i> un 23 10	EMAIL NOTES TO PREPARE FOR NEGO	TIATION WITH	FATELL	0.30
Jun 23 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. SI M. JACOBS AND A. LEWIS REGARDIN WITH NOVELL		FATELL	0.50
Jun 23 10	FOLLOW-UP CALL WITH S, SINGER		FATELL	0.20
Jun 30 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPA		FATELL	0.50
Jun 30 10	REVIEW MEETING AGENDA .1		FATELL	0.10
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 06	TOTAL VALUE:	\$5,065.50	7.80

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	DE: 11			
Jun 01 10	EMAIL B. COMER REGARDING SALE	OF ASSETS	FATELL	0.10
Jun 02 10	EMAILS REGARDING MEETING TO DI		FATELL	0.20
Jun 03 10	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TRUSTEE, REGARDING STRUCTURE FOR ASSET		PATELL	0.80
Jun 03 10	EMAILS WITH M. HAKIM REGARDING OF ASSETS	NON-DEBTOR SALE	TARR	0.20
Jun 17 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. C FISLER REGARDING SALE PROCESS TO EMPLOYEES AND CUSTOMERS		FATELL	0.30
PROJECT COL	DE TOTALS 11	TOTAL VALUE:	\$1,027.00	1.60

DATE	narrative		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COI	DE: 15			
Jun 17 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND	•	MOODY	0.60
	PREPARE NOTICE OF CANCELLATION (HEARING	OF JUNE 21		
Jun 17 10	SCAND, EFILLE AND SERVE NOTICE	OF HEARING	MOODY	0.20
	CANCELLATION FOR 6/21/10			
PROJECT COI	DE TOTALS 15	TOTAL VALUE:	\$168.00	0.80

DATE NARRATIVE TIMEKEEPER HOURS

REPORT TOTALS TOTAL VALUE: 22,173.50 57.10

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS