Exhibit A

EDWARD N.CAHN ATTORNEY SUMMARY JULY 1, 2010 TO JULY 31, 2010

Name of Professional	Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
l aumhainean A	Partner Since 1994, Member of PA Bar Since 1984,	\$630.00	1.50	\$045.00
Laupheimer, A	Area of Expertise - Litigation Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981,	\$030.00	1.00	\$945.00
	Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise -			
Fatell, B.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$710.00	12.50	\$8,875.00
	Partner Since 1991 Member of PA Bar Since 1985,			
Kelbon, R.	Area of Expertise - Bankruptcy	\$625.00	0.2	\$125,00
,	Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986,			
Storreo, J.	Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$655.00	11.0	\$7,205.00
	Associate, Member of DE Bar Since 2003,			
Root, A	Area of Expertise - Financial services	\$280.00	0.1	\$28.00
	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2007,			
Landsburg, M	Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$305.00		\$1,708.00
	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2009,		,	
Bee, J	Area of Expertise - Financial Services/Real Estate	\$260.00	1.00	\$260.00
	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007,			
Stefanski, J	Area of Expertise - Business	\$305.00	13.20	\$4,026.00
	Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000,			
Casey Spaniel, L	Area of Expertise - Business	\$430.00		
Moody, T.	Paralegal (Since 1996)	\$220.00	14.20	\$3,124.00
Grand Total:			89.20	\$39,153.00

EDWARD N.CAHN PROJECT CODE SUMMARY JULY 1, 2010 TO JULY 31, 2010

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters	0.0	\$0.00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	12.1	\$2,760.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	0.9	\$198.00
4	Debtors' Business Operations	14.4	\$7,244.00
5	Case Administration	0.3	\$66.00
6	IP Licensing	0.7	\$497.00
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	0.0	\$0.00
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.1	\$28.00
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	0.0	\$0.00
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	60.1	\$28,228.00
12	Stay Relief Issues	0.0	\$0.00
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0.00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	0.6	\$132.00
16	Non-Working Travel	0.0	\$0.00
	TOTALS	89.2	\$39,153.00

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 02			
Jul 19 10	REVIEW AND APPROVE FOR FILING CNC	REGARDING	FATELL	0.20
Jul 19 10	PREPARE CERTIFICATES OF NO OBJECT ROME'S 3RD AND 4TH APPLICATIONS	'ION TO BLANK	УДООМ	0.20
Jul 22 10	ATTENTION TO EDIT, REVIEW OF VARI PETITIONS FOR THE PREPARATION OF APPLICATIONS		МООДУ	5.00
Jul 23 10	REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PREPARE FIFTH MONTHLY FEE APPLICA 2.5	•	мооду	3.00
Jul 26 10	PREPARE 6TH MONTHLLY APPLICATION		MOODY	3.70
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 02	OTAL VALUE:	\$2,760.00	12.10

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COD	E: 03			
Jul 01 10	FINALIZE PAPERS, SCAN, EFILE	AND SERVE OPA'S	MOODY	0.60
	8TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION			
7-1 20 20		D TRANSCOL MA AAAAA		
Jul 19 10	PREPARE CERTIFICATES OF NO C		MOODY	0.30
	PARKS 7TH AND 8TH MONTHLY FE	E APPLICATIONS		
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 03	TOTAL VALUE:	\$198.00	0.90

DATE	NARRATIVE	Timekeeper	HOURS
PROJECT COD	RE: 04 REVIEW AND DISCUSS WITH J. BEE DEMAND LETTER TO CUSTOMER	FATELL	0.20
Jul 01 10	CALL WITH OPA REGARDING UPDATE ON VARIOUS RESTRUCTURING ISSUES	FATELL	1.10
Jul 01 10	REVIEW DEMAND LETTER; LETTER TO CUSTOMERS AND EDIT REGARDING VARIOUS OPERATIONAL ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Jul 01 10	REVIEW NOTICE OF TEAM 1 SYSTEMS CHAPTER 7 BANKRUPTCY; EMAILS WITH B. FATELL AND M. HAKIM REGARDING DEMAND LETTERS TO XILINK AND MEMOSIS SISTEMAS	BEE	0.40
Jul 02 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPA, TRUSTEE AND REPRESENTATIVES FROM SCO INDIA	PATELL	0.60
Jul 02 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING INDIA SUBSIDIARY	FATELL	0.20
Jul 02 10	REVIEW DRAFT CUSTOMER LETTER AND EDIT	FATELL	0.20
Jul 02 10	REVIEW APRIL MOR AND APPROVE FOR FILING	FATELL	0.30
Jul 06 10	SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS	MOODY	0.50
Jul 13 10	REVIEW MATERIALS TO PREPARE FOR CALL WITH OPA	FATELL	0.30
Jul 13 10	UPDATE CALL WITH OPA ON MULTIPLE BUSINESS OPERATION ISSUES	FATELL	1.30
Jul 16 10	TELEPHONE TRUSTEE REGARDING VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.20
Jul 19 10	EMAILS REGARDING D&O COVERAGE	FATELL	0.20
Jul 21 10	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH A. LAUPHEIMER AND B. FATELL ON INSURANCE ISSUES	KELBON	0,20
Jul 22 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH A. LAUPHEIMER AND D&O INSURER (.3); EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING SAME (.2)	FATELL	0.50
Jul 22 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING OPERATIONS AND COLLECTIONS, INSURANCE	FATELL	0.50
Jul 26 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M, FISLER REGARDING OPERATIONS	FATELL	0.20
Jul 26 10	EMAILS REGARDING DGO INSURANCE (.1); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH AGENT (.1)	FATELL	0.20
Jul 28 10	EMAIL TO CONFIRM BINDING D&O INSURANCE	FATELL	0.10

DATE	NARRATIVE		Timekeeper	HOURS
Jul 28 10	PHONE CALL WITH J. STEFANSKI REG (.3); REVIEW EMAIL SUMMARIZING (.2)		LANDSBURG	REPACTED
Jul 29 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH OPA AN REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES	D R. TIBBETTS	FATELL	0.60
Jul 29 10	RESPOND TO CONTRACT QUESTION		LANDSBURG	2.40
Jul 29 10	REVIEW COMMUNICATIONS WITH SCO'S AND RELATED PURCHASE ORDERS FOR DEMAND LETTER		BEE	0.60
Jul 30 10	RESPOND TO INQUIRY REGARDING CON	TRACTS	LANDSBURG	2.70
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 04	TOTAL VALUE:	\$7,244.00	14.40

DATE		NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE	3: 05				
Jul 06 10	REVIEW UP	DATED DOCKET	SHEETS	УДООМ	0.10
Jul 19 10	REVIEW UP	DATED DOCKET	SHEETS AND PLEADING	s Moody	0.20
PROJECT CODE	E TOTALS	05	TOTAL VAL	UE: \$66.00	0.30

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE	3: 06			
Jul 12 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASE	REGARDING	FATELL	0.20
	OFFERING MEMORANDUM			
Jul 12 10	EMAILS REGARDING APPEAL		FATELL	0.10
Jul 15 10	EMAIL WITH NOVELL COUNSEL REGARDING	G POSSIBLE	FATELL	0.20
Jul 15 10	EMAILS TO S. SINGER AND J. NORMAN)	FATELL	0.20
PROJECT CODE	TOTALS 06 TO	TAL VALUE;	\$497.00	0.70

DATE	NARCATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE	E: 08 PROVIDE GUIDANCE TO J. BEE REGARDING FILING O	F ROOT	0.10
	PROOF OF CLAIM		
PROJECT CODE	E TOTALS 08 TOTAL VALUE:	\$28.00	0.10

... . ,

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT COL	DE: 11 EMAIL L. CASEY REGARDING DUE DILIGENCE ON SALE	Patell	0.10
			0.10
Jul 05 10	PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF TEASER FOR SALE AND DATA ROOM MATERIALS	Casey Span	1.20
Jul 06 10	FOLLOW UP WITH B. FATELL REGARDING MATERIALS FOR SALE (.2); FOLLOW UP WITH M. FISLER REGARDING TEASER AND INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (.3)	CASEY SPAN	0.50
Jul 06 10	DUE DILIGENCE REVIEW OF SCO DATA ROOM AND TEASER PROVIDED FOR PURCHASE AGREEMENT (.6); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (.3)	STEFANSKI	1.00
Jul 07 10	REVIEW AND REVISE SUMMARY OF ISSUES IN DATA ROOM FOR SALE (.5); REVIEW INFORMATION MEMORANDUM FOR SALE (1.0)	CASEY SPAN	1.50
Jul 07 10	COMPLETE REVIEW OF DATAROOM (.7); DRAFT EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING DATA ROOM AND TEASER (.7); CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING SAME (.2)	STEFANSKI	1.60
Jul 08 10	EMAILS TO GROUP	STORERO	0.20
Jul 08 10	FOLLOW UP WITH J. STORERO AND R. KELBON REGARDING OUTSTANDING ISSUES IN INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (.5); REVIEW PUBLIC FILINGS AND ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF STATEMENTS IN MEMORANDUM (.9)	CASEY SPAN	1.40
Jul 08 10	REVIEW AND REVISE CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION MEMO FOR SALE OF COMPANY (1.7); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (.6)	stefanski	2.30
Jul 09 10	REVIEW DOCUMENT AND PROVIDE COMMENTS	STORERO	1.60
Jul 09 10	FINALIZE REVISIONS TO NON-DISCLOSURE AGREEMENT AND FOLLOW UP WITH V. BHAT (.4); FINALIZE SUMMARY OF INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY ISSUES IN INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (.4)	CASEY SPAN	0.80
Jul 09 10	COMPLETE REVISIONS TO CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION MEMO (1.4); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (.2)	STEFANSKI	1.60
Jul 12 10	PREPARE RIDERS; CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING ISSUES REGARDING SALE OF ASSETS	STORERO	0.60
Jul 12 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO REGARDING ISSUES IN INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH M. HAKIM REGARDING ADDITIONAL COMMENTS	CASEY SPAN	2.20

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	TO INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (1.3); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND V. BHAT REGARDING NON-DISCLOSURE AGRE EMENT AND INFORMATION MEMORANDUM (.3); FOLLOW UP WITH B. FATELL REGARDING ISSUES FOR SALE (.3)		
Jul 14 10	REVIEW AND EDIT CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION MEMO	FATELL	0.70
Jul 14 10	REVISE AND EDIT NON-DISCLOSURE AGREEMENT AND EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO L. CASEY REGARDING SAME	STEFANSKI	0.70
Jul 15 10	REVIEW AND EDIT COMPANY SUMMARY OF LITIGATION FOR SALE PROCESS	FATELL	0.30
Jul 15 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER AND M. HAKIN TO REVISE INFORMATION MEMORANDUM FOR SALE	FATELL	0.80
Jul 15 10	REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM L. CASEY AND LICENSE AGREEMENT DOCUMENTS AND COURT DOCUMENTS REGARDING LICENSE AGREEMENT	STEFANSKI	0.20
Jul 19 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND M. HAKIM REGARDING SALE PROCESS, TIMELINE, ASSETS, ETC.	FATELL	0.60
Jul 19 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE AND EMAIL TO OPA REGARDING EEGIN SALE PROCESS	FATELL,	0.20
Jul 19 10	REVIEW MATERIALS PROVIDED BY R. TIBBETTS	Casey span	4.20
	REGARDING (2.3); ADDITIONAL RESEARCH ON (1.9)	REDICTO	-0
Jul 19 10		stefanski FORCT60	
Jul 20 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY AND TRUSTEE REGARDING SALE	FATELL	0.70
Jul 20 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY REGARDING SALE	FATELL	0.20
Jul 20 10	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF PREVIOUS AGREEMENTS AND OTHER MATERIALS PROVIDED BY R. TIBBETTS (1.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING STRATEGIES TO PROCEED WITH SALE (.8)	CASEY SPAN	2,60
Jul 21 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER AND REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING SALE	FATELL	0.30
Jul 21 10	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. BUDZINSKI REGARDING SALE MOTION AND PROCEDURES	FATELL	0.40
Jul 21 10	REVIEW ADDITIONAL MATERIALS ON BACKGROUND	CASEY SPAN	3.90

DATE	NARRATIVE		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Jul 29 10	REVIEW REVISED DOCUMENT		STORERO	0.70
PROJECT COD	E TOTALS 11	TOTAL VALUE:	\$28.228.00	60.10

DATE	narrative		TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE:	15			
Jul 07 10 PF	EPARE NOTICE OF 7/12/10 HE	ARING CANCELLATION	MOODY	0.20
	VISE, SCAN, EFILE AND SERVI 12/10 HEARING CANCELLATION	NOTICEE OF	MOODY	0.40
PROJECT CODE T	OTALS 15	TOTAL VALUE:	\$132.00	0.60

DATE NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER HOURS

REPORT TOTALS

TOTAL VALUE:

39,153.00

89.20

DATE

NARRATIVE

TIMEKEEPER

HOURS