

EXHIBIT A

EDWARD N.CAHN
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
APRIL 1, 2011 TO APRIL 30, 2011

| Name of Professional | Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise | Hourly Billing Rate | Total Billed Hours | Total Compensation |
|-----------------------------|---|----------------------------|---------------------------|---------------------------|
| DeBaecke, M. | Partner Since 2001, Member of DE Since 1993, Member of PA Since 1994, Area of Expertise - Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy | \$575.00 | 0.20 | \$115.00 |
| Fatell, B. | Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981, Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy | \$710.00 | 40.90 | \$29,039.00 |
| Gamburg, D | Partner Since 2009 Member of PA Bar Since 1996, Area of Expertise - Employment, Benefits and Labor | \$465.00 | 0.20 | \$93.00 |
| Storreo, J. | Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986, Area of Expertise - Public Companies | \$655.00 | 21.80 | \$14,279.00 |
| Hitchens, K | Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007, Area of Expertise - Financial Services | \$295.00 | 53.00 | \$15,635.00 |
| Root, A | Associate, Member of DE Bar Since 2010, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy | \$280.00 | 0.3 | \$84.00 |
| Neiswender, V | Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2006, Area of Expertise Employment, Benefits and Labor | \$425.00 | 8.30 | \$3,527.50 |
| Tarr, S. | Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005 Member of DE, PA Bar Since 2010 Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy | \$425.00 | 41.40 | \$17,595.00 |
| Stefanski, J | Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007, Area of Expertise - Business | \$305.00 | 0.30 | \$91.50 |
| Casey Spaniel, L | Associate, Member of PA and NJ Bar Since 2000, Area of Expertise - Business | \$430.00 | 2.00 | \$860.00 |
| Moody, T. | Paralegal (Since 1996) | \$220.00 | 2.40 | \$528.00 |
| Senese, K. | Paralegal (Since 1993) | \$250.00 | 0.10 | \$25.00 |
| Kirchner, K | Paralegal (Since 1998) | \$265.00 | 7.90 | \$2,093.50 |
| Grand Total: | | | 178.80 | \$83,965.50 |

EDWARD N. CAHN
PROJECT CODE SUMMARY
APRIL 1, 2011 TO APRIL 30, 2011

| PROJECT CODE | PROJECT CATEGORY | TOTAL HOURS | TOTAL FEES |
|--------------|--|--------------|--------------------|
| 1 | Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 2 | Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications | 4.7 | \$1,993.00 |
| 3 | Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues | 1.8 | \$560.00 |
| 4 | Debtors' Business Operations | 19.1 | \$7,256.00 |
| 5 | Case Administration | 0.6 | \$135.00 |
| 6 | IP Licensing | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 7 | Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 8 | Claims Analysis and Objections | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 9 | Employee Benefits / General Labor | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 10 | Plan & Disclosure Statement | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 11 | Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement | 152.6 | \$74,021.50 |
| 12 | Stay Relief Issues | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 13 | Tax Issues | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 14 | Asset Analysis and Recovery | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 15 | Hearings - Attendance / Preparation | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| 16 | Non-Working Travel | 0.0 | \$0.00 |
| | TOTALS | 178.8 | \$83,965.50 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 02 Blank Rome Fee/Employment Applications

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|--|------------|------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/12/2011 | REVIEW RETENTION ORDER FOR OPA AND EMAIL B. COMER REGARDING FEES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PREVIOUSLY FILED CERTIFICATES OF NO OBJECTION | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.30 | 66.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | ATTENTION TO FEE APPLICATION ISSUES (2.5) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.50 | 1,062.50 |
| 4/27/2011 | ATTENTION TO PREPARATION OF INVOICES | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.30 | 552.50 |
| 4/28/2011 | INTERNAL EMAILS REGARDING INVOICES (0.4) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.40 | 170.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 03 Other Professionals' Fee/Employment Issues

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|-----------------|-------|--------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS(0.1); PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO OCEAN PARK ADVISORS 16TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION(0.2) | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.30 | 66.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | SCAN, EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION TO OCEAN PARK'S 16TH MONTHLY APPLICATION | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.20 | 44.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE FOR 17TH MONTHLY APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION OF OCEAN PARK ADVISORS(0.2); SCAN, EFILE AND SERVE SAME(0.3) | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.50 | 110.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVISE OPA FEE APPLICATION (0.4), CNO (0.2) AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING OF SAME | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.60 | 255.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING FEE APPLICATION | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.20 | 85.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 04 Debtors' Business Operations

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|----------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/4/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH K. HITCHENS(0.2); REVIEW EMAIL MESSAGES FROM K. HITCHENS(0.2); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGES TO K. HITCHENS(0.2); SEARCH DELAWARE CORPORATE DATABASE FOR INFORMATION ON SCO GLOBAL, INC.(0.3); PREPARE AFFIDAVIT OF LOST CERTIFICATE AND ASSIGNMENT SEPARATE FROM CERTIFICATE FOR THE SCO GROUP INC.(0.5); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO K. HITCHENS ALONG WITH AFFIDAVIT OF LOST CERTIFICATE AND ASSIGNMENT SEPARATE FROM CERTIFICATE FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT(0.2); PREPARE STOCK CERTIFICATE AND SUBMIT TO K. HITCHENS(0.4) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 2.00 | 530.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | REVIEW EMAIL MESSAGE FROM K. HITCHENS(0.2); REVIEW DELAWARE STATUTES(0.2); (2) TELEPHONE CONVERSATIONS WITH CT CORPORATION REGARDING CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT FILINGS FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS, INC.(0.3); CONFERENCE WITH K. SENESE REGARDING AMENDMENT ATTESTATIONS(0.2); REVIEW INFORMATION RECEIVED FROM K. SENESE(0.2); PREPARE ACTION BY WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS, INC.(1.5); PREPARE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS, INC.(1.0); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO S. TARR AND K. HITCHENS ALONG WITH ACTION BY WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE AND CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT PREPARED ON BEHALF OF THE SCO GROUP INC. FOR REVIEW AND COMMENT(0.4) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 4.00 | 1,060.00 |

Info-Only Proforma Time Detail Report

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 04 Debtors' Business Operations

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|----------------------|-------|--------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/14/2011 | REVIEW COMMENTS FROM S. TARR ON THE ACTION BY WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE AND THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT PREPARED ON BEHALF OF THE SCO GROUP, INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS INC.(0.1); REVISE ACTION BY WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE AND THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS INC.(0.1); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO S. TARR, K. HITCHENS, J. STORERO AND B. FATTELL WITH ACTION BY WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE AND THE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT FOR THE SCO GROUP, INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS INC. FOR REVIEW AND EXECUTION(0.2) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 0.40 | 106.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | EMAIL AND TELEPHONE S. TARR REGARDING NAME CHANGE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. TARR REGARDING NAME CHANGE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | TELEPHONE CONVERSATION WITH INCORPORATING SERVICES REGARDING AMENDMENT FILINGS(0.1); REVIEW DOCUMENTS RECEIVED FROM E. CAHN(0.1); PREPARE CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENTS FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS, INC. FOR FILING WITH THE STATE OF DELAWARE; SCAN AMENDMENTS INTO PDF FORMAT(0.2); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO INCORPORATING SERVICES ALONG WITH CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENTS FOR FILING(0.1) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 0.50 | 132.50 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 04 Debtors' Business Operations

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|--|------------|----------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/20/2011 | REVISE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT AND RESUBMIT TO INCORPORATING SERVICES FOR FILING FOR SCO OPERATIONS INC.(0.1); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO K. HITCHENS, J. STORERO, L. CASEY, B. FATELL, B. COMER, K. NIELSEN AND S. TARR ALONG WITH EVIDENCE OF FILING OF THE CERTIFICATES OF AMENDMENTS FOR SCO OPERATIONS, INC. AND THE SCO GROUP, INC.(0.2) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 0.30 | 79.50 |
| 4/20/2011 | EMAILS REGARDING NAME CHANGE STATUS | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.40 | 170.00 |
| 4/21/2011 | REVISIONS TO IC AGREEMENTS FOR EASTON, GARDNER, BRADFORD AND GILBERT AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME (2.0); RESEARCH REGARDING CASE ISSUE AND EMAIL DOCUMENTS REGARDING SAME TO B. FATELL (0.6); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING A/R (0.4); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING 401K (0.3) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 3.30 | 1,402.50 |
| 4/25/2011 | REVIEW EMAILS BETWEEN OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING STATUS | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.40 | 170.00 |
| 4/26/2011 | REVIEW EMAIL MESSAGE FROM K. NEILSEN REGARDING INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICES NOTIFICATION FOR THE SCO GROUP INC. AND SCO OPERATIONS INC.(0.2); PREPARE LETTERS TO THE INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICES(0.1); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO K. NEILSEN(0.1) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 0.40 | 106.00 |
| 4/26/2011 | FINALIZE, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS FOR FEBRUARY | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.40 | 88.00 |
| 4/26/2011 | REVIEW MORS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING OF SAME (0.5) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.50 | 212.50 |
| 4/27/2011 | ATTEND WEEKLY CALL REGARDING POST-CLOSING MATTERS (1.5); REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING OPA UPDATE (0.4); EMAIL TRUSTEE REGARDING EXECUTION DOCUMENTS (0.2); REVIEW R. TIBBITTS EMAIL REGARDING SAME (0.3) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.40 | 1,020.00 |
| 4/28/2011 | TELEPHONE B. COMER REGARDING PAYMENT OF ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/28/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING POST CLOSING MATTERS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.70 | 497.00 |

Info-Only Proforma Time Detail Report

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 04 Debtors' Business Operations

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|--|------------|----------------------|-------|--------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/28/2011 | PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO J. STORERO, L. CASEY, B. FATELL, K. HITCHENS, S. TARR, C. VALENTINO, K. NIELSEN AND B. COMER REGARDING CORPORATE ADDRESS TO BE USED ON INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICES CORRESPONDENCE; REVISE INTERNAL REVENUE SERVICES CORRESPONDENCE(0.1); PREPARE AND SEND EMAIL MESSAGE TO C. VALENTINO(0.2) | 01935 | Kathleen M. Kirchner | 0.30 | 79.50 |
| 4/28/2011 | EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING DATAROOM DVD (0.2); EMAIL REGARDING TRUSTEE APPOINTMENT ORDER (0.2); REVIEW TRUSTEE EMAIL REGARDING SAME (0.2); REVIEW IRS EMAILS (0.4) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.00 | 425.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | REVIEW DEBTOR LOAN AGREEMENT AND EMAIL E. NEIGER | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | CONFER WITH B. FATELL, B. COMER REGARDING LENDERS' LETTER (0.2); REVIEW LETTER (0.2); RESEARCH DOCUMENTS AND EMAIL B. FATELL, B. COMER REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW B. FATELL EMAILS TO LENDERS' COUNSEL (0.3) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.10 | 467.50 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 05 Case Administration

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|--|------------|-----------------|-------|-------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/12/2011 | RECIEVE BILL FROM VERITEX AND SUBMIT CHECK REQUEST FOR 3/2/11 HEARING TRANSCRIPT | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.20 | 44.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | FINAIZE, EFILE AND COORDINATE HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS OF CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING STIPULATION AMONG THE CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE, UNXIS, INC. AND ORACLE AMERICA, INC. | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.30 | 66.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | ONLINE INQUIRY (BANKRUPTCY DOCKET AND SEC FILING) REGARDING DEBTOR'S LOAN AGREEMENT DATED 3-5-2010 | 02238 | Kathleen Senese | 0.10 | 25.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|----------|---|------------|-----------------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/1/2011 | CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COMER (.40); REVIEW DOCUMENTS AND REVISE SAME (1.2); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG REGARDING CLOSING MATTERS (.50); TELEPHONE CALL TO S. TARR (.20) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 2.30 | 1,506.50 |
| 4/1/2011 | EXCHANGE E-MAILS WITH J. STORERO REGARDING INDEPENDENT CONTRACTOR AGREEMENT | 02159 | Donald D. Gamburg | 0.20 | 93.00 |
| 4/1/2011 | REVIEW EMAILS FROM FOREIGN COUNSELS AND DISTRIBUTE DOCUMENTATION FOR EXECUTION (2.4); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH M. FINE REGARDING CLOSING (.5); MEETINGS WITH J. STORERO REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO WORKING GROUP EMAILS (2.0); REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT (1.5); DRAFT FORM OF CONSULTING AGREEMENT (2.0); REVISE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.5) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 9.40 | 2,773.00 |
| 4/1/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING THE TRANSFER OF EMPLOYEE BENEFIT PLANS TO UNXIS, INC. | 02594 | Virginia Escobar Neiswender | 0.60 | 255.00 |
| 4/3/2011 | REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING SALE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/3/2011 | REVIEW AND COMMENT ON LANDLORD CONSENT | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/4/2011 | REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING CLOSE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/4/2011 | WORKING GROUP CALL (.50); CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER (.30); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40); REVISE AGREEMENT (.60); TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. FATELL (.1); EMAILS TO B. FATELL (.1) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 2.00 | 1,310.00 |
| 4/4/2011 | GUIDANCE TO S. TARR REGARDING ORACLE CONTRACTS | 01972 | Michael D. Debaecke | 0.20 | 115.00 |
| 4/4/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (.8); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. KIRCHNER REGARDING SCO GLOBAL (.2); REVIEW CLOSING ISSUES (.2); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING CLOSING (.5); UPDATE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.0) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 2.70 | 796.50 |
| 4/4/2011 | REVIEW AND REVISE LETTERS TO SERVICE PROVIDERS REGARDING TRANSFER OF EMPLOYEE BENEFIT PLANS TO UNXIS, INC.(0.5); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFITS ISSUES(0.5); DRAFT AMENDMENT TO SCO GROUP WELFARE BENEFIT PLAN (1.4) | 02594 | Virginia Escobar Neiswender | 2.40 | 1,020.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|----------|--|------------|-----------------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/4/2011 | ATTEND DAILY SALE CLOSING CALL (0.5); RESEARCH STIPULATION ISSUE (0.5) AND CONFER WITH M. DEBAECKE REGARDING DE PRACTICE FOR SAME (0.3); ATTEND TO VARIOUS SALE ISSUES, INCLUDING REVIEW OF NUMEROUS EMAILS (2.0) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 3.30 | 1,402.50 |
| 4/5/2011 | MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES AND NJ LEASE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | REVIEW TSA AND COMMENTS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | TEAM MEETING TO REVIEW OPEN ISSUES AND TSA | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.60 | 1,136.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | REPORT TO TRUSTEE ON STATUS OF SALE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | TELEPHONE B. COMER REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | SALES TEAM CALL WITH BUYER | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | EMAIL WITH J. NEUFELD REGARDING FOREIGN SUBS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.20); RESPOND TO EMAILS (.40); EMAIL B. FATELL (.1); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40); GROUP CALL (.80); REVIEW EMAILS AND RESPOND (.40) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 2.40 | 1,572.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (.2); EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.4); UPDATE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.8); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WORKING GROUP (2.6); MEETING WITH J. STORERO REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT (1.0); REVIEW AND REVISE FORM OF WARRANT (2.0) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 8.40 | 2,478.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | REVIEW AND ADDRESS TRANSITION OF EMPLOYEE BENEFITS ISSUES | 02594 | Virginia Escobar Neiswender | 3.20 | 1,360.00 |
| 4/5/2011 | ATTEND SCO CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING TRANSITION AGREEMENT (1.7); REVIEW TRANSITION AGREEMENT (0.6); ATTEND TO VARIOUS SALE ISSUES (1.0) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 3.30 | 1,402.50 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 2.40 | 1,704.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS RE CLOSING ITEMS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.80 | 568.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAILS R. TIBBITTS RE ATTORNEY CLIENT DOCUMENTS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | DISCUSS K. NEILSON CONTRACT WITH B. COMER | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|----------|---|------------|-----------------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/6/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE B. COMER RE VARIOUS CLOSING ITEMS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.60 | 426.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE RE INDIA TAX ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAIL RE THE OPEN GROUP | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAIL WITH L. CASEY RE IP ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW SEC NOTICE AND RELATED EMAIL | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAILS RE ALLEN AND OVERY FEES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K.. HITCHINS AND J. STORERO RE STOCK WARRANT, REVIEW WARRANT AND DISCUSS COMMENTS, INCLUDE B. COMER FOR PART OF CALL | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.80 | 568.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | MONITOR EMAILS RE EMPLOYEE BENEFITS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | FINALIZE REVISIONS TO TRADEMARK ASSIGNMENT DOCUMENT FOR MOBILITY ASSETS | 01761 | Lisa M. Casey Spaniel | 0.80 | 344.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW WARRANT (.40); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40);01848 REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSACTION SERVICES AGREEMENT (.40); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (.20); CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER (.30); RESPOND TO EMAILS (.20); GROUP CALL (.50); CALL WITH M. FINE (.40); RESPOND TO EMAILS (.40) | | Jane K. Storero | 3.20 | 2,096.00 |
| 4/6/2011 | REVIEW AND REVISE WARRANT (.9); REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (1.1); REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT (2.9); MEETINGS WITH J. STORERO; B. FATELL AND B. COMER REGARDING CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND ISSUES (1.8); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING CLOSING (.3); UPDATE CLOSING DOCUMENTS AND CLOSING CHECKLIST (1.7) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 8.70 | 2,566.50 |
| 4/6/2011 | PREPARE FOR TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH BENEFITS CONSULTANT FOR UNXIS, INC. TO DISCUSS TRANSFER OF EMPLOYEE BENEFITS(1.0); DRAFT AND REVISE LANGUAGE REGARDING UK TRANSFER(1.1) | 02594 | Virginia Escobar Neiswender | 2.10 | 892.50 |
| 4/6/2011 | EMAILS WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING SIGNATURES FOR SALE DOCUMENTS (0.3); ATTEND TO VARIOUS MATTERS REGARDING SALE CLOSING (1.0); DRAFT ORACLE STIPULATION AND EXHIBIT (2.5) AND EMAIL COUNSEL REGARDING SAME | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 3.80 | 1,615.00 |
| 4/7/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |

Info-Only Proforma Time Detail Report

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|----------|---|------------|-----------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/7/2011 | REVIEW CLOSING AGENDAS, EMAILS REGARDING PAYMENTS, CURE, ETC. | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/7/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER (.2); CALL WITH J. STORERO AND K. HITCHENS REGARDING CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.70 | 497.00 |
| 4/7/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND B. COMER (.30); RESPOND TO EMAILS (.40); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40); CONFERENCE WITH M. FINE (.40); REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT (.40); EMAIL K. KITCHENS (.20); GROUP CALL (.20); CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL (.20) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 2.50 | 1,637.50 |
| 4/7/2011 | UPDATE AND DISTRIBUTE CLOSING CHECKLIST (.5); TELEPHONE CONFERENCES WITH BUYER'S COUNSEL REGARDING CLOSING (.8); CONFERENCE CALLS WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING CLOSING (2.0); MEETING WITH J. STORERO REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES (.4); REVIEW AND REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT (2.3); REVIEW AND REVISE FORM OF WARRANT (.5); REVIEW AND REVISE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.7) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 7.20 | 2,124.00 |
| 4/7/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO SEVERAL EMAILS REGARDING SALE MATTERS (1.0) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.00 | 425.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | ADDRESS ISSUES REGARDING SVRX | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.60 | 426.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH K. HITCHENS (2 CALLS) | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | EMAIL WITH S. TARR AND DISCUSS LEASE ISSUES WITH J. STORERO; EMAIL TO M. FINE REGARDING SAME | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.60 | 426.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40); CONFERENCE WITH M. FINE (.60); CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER (.40); TELEPHONE CALL TO B. COMER (.30); REVISE AGREEMENT (.40); CONFERENCE CALL WITH GRUOP (1.5) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 3.60 | 2,358.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | CONFERENCE CALLS REGARDING CLOSING (1.8); REVIEW AND ADDRESS CLOSING ISSUES (3.6) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 5.40 | 1,593.00 |
| 4/8/2011 | DRAFT ASSIGNMENT LETTER (0.8); REVISE EXHIBIT TO ORACLE STIPULATION (0.5) AND EMAIL SAME (0.2); SEVERAL EMAILS REGARDING SALE CLOSING ISSUES (0.5) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.00 | 850.00 |

Info-Only Proforma Time Detail Report

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|-----------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/9/2011 | RESPOND TO EMAILS (.60); TELEPHONE CALL TO B. FATELL (.20) | 01848 | Jane K. Storer | 0.80 | 524.00 |
| 4/9/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING CLOSING | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 0.80 | 236.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | EMAILS AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO REGARDING CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | REVIEW CHANGES TO TA REGARDING SALE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | TEAM CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING TA AND SALE CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.80 | 568.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | REVIEW EMAIL FROM R. TIBBITTS REGARDING COLLECTING A/R AND RESPOND TO MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING COLLECTION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING REAL PROPERTY LEASES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. NIELSEN REGARDING BANKING PROCEDURES POST CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO REGARDING BUYER ISSUES REGARDING CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | REVIEW PRESS RELEASE ISSUED BY BUYER AND DISCUSS WITH J. STORERO | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | TELEPHONE B. COMER REGARDING BUYER ISSUES REGARDING SALE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | EMAILS REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.40); RESPOND TO EMAILS (.40); REVIEW CHANGES (.50); REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT (.20); CONFERENCES WITH B. COMER (.60); CONFERENCE WITH M. FINE (.60); REVIEW AND REVISE AGREEMENT (.60); CONFERENCE WITH GROUP (.60) | 01848 | Jane K. Storer | 3.90 | 2,554.50 |
| 4/11/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (.6); REVISE TRANSITION AGREEMENT (2.5); MEETING WITH J. STORERO REGARDING TRANSITION AGREEMENT (.5); UPDATE CLOSING DOCUMENTS (1.5); CONFERENCE CALL WITH WORKING GROUP REGARDING CLOSING (.8); REVISE BUYER CLOSING DOCUMENTS (.4); ADDRESS MISCELLANEOUS CLOSING ISSUES (1.9) | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 8.20 | 2,419.00 |
| 4/11/2011 | ATTENTION TO VARIOUS CLOSING ISSUES, EMAILS, INCLUDING CONFERENCES WITH B. FATELL, B. COMER, DRAFTING LEASE ACKNOWLEDGEMENT LETTER (2.7) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.70 | 1,147.50 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|-----------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/12/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING POST CLOSING ITEMS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | ATTEND TO POST CLOSING MATTERS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.80 | 1,278.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | EMAIL WITH S. TARR REGARDING CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE TO DISCUSS CLOSING AND NEXT STEPS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | DRAFT LETTER TO R. TIBBETTS AND K. NIELSEN ON BEHALF OF THE TRUSTEE AND POST CLOSING BUSINESS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. TARR REGARDING MULTIPLE POST-CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING POST CLOSING ITEMS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | REVIEW PROCEDURE FOR NAME CHANGE AND DISCUSS WITH S. TARR | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | RESPOND TO EMAILS (.20) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 0.20 | 131.00 |
| 4/12/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING POST-CLOSING ISSUES | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 1.90 | 560.50 |
| 4/12/2011 | EMAIL MEMO TO B. FATELL REGARDING OPA FEES (0.4); REVIEW EMAIL AMONG, BR, OPA, SCO REGARDING CLOSING (0.5); EMAILS WITH B. FATELL, R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SALE ISSUES (0.4); RESEARCH, EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING CAPTION MOTION (0.5); EMAILS WITH ORACLE COUNSEL (0.4) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.20 | 935.00 |
| 4/13/2011 | PREPARE LETTER FOR TRUSTEE TO R. TIBBITTS AND K. NIELSEN | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/13/2011 | MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING POST CLOSING MATTERS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/13/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING SUN RAY CLAIM | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/13/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS (.20); TELEPHONE CALL TO B. FATELL (.1) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 0.30 | 196.50 |
| 4/13/2011 | REVISE CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT, WRITTEN CONSENT (0.8); REVISE ORACLE STIPULATION AND EXHIBIT AFTER EMAILS WITH ORACLE'S COUNSEL (0.7); REVIEW EMAILS FROM R. TIBBITTS (0.3); ATTENTION TO NJ LEASE ACKNOWLEDGEMENT (0.7); RESEARCH AND MEMO REGARDING INDIA LITIGANT TO B. FATELL, R. TIBBITTS (0.5) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 3.00 | 1,275.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING WIND-DOWN ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|---|------------|-----------------------|-------|--------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/14/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING REPORTS ON ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | EMAILS REGARDING TRANSFER OF THE TRADEMARK LICENSE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/14/2011 | RESPOND TO EMAILS (.20); CONFERENCE WITH K. BERG (.1) | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 0.30 | 196.50 |
| 4/14/2011 | REVIEW AND RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING POST-CLOSING ITEMS | 02466 | Katharine E. Hitchens | 0.30 | 88.50 |
| 4/14/2011 | REVISE EXHIBIT A TO STIPULATION (0.2), ORACLE STIPULATION (0.4), AND EMAILS WITH ORACLE REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW SALE RELATED EMAILS (0.3) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.30 | 552.50 |
| 4/15/2011 | REVIEW NEWS REPORTS REGARDING SALE AND LITIGATION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | EMAILS REGARDING STIPULATION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | COMMUNICATIONS WITH S. TARR REGARDING CERTAIN SALE RELATED ISSUES | 02622 | Alan M. Root | 0.30 | 84.00 |
| 4/15/2011 | CONFER WITH M. FINE REGARDING ORACLE STIPULATION (0.3); FINALIZE SAME AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING (0.3); DRAFT COC REGARDING SAME (0.7); EMAILS, CONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING SIGNATURE PAGES (0.4); RESEARCH CAPTION MOTION AND BEGIN PREPARATION OF SAME (0.4) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 2.10 | 892.50 |
| 4/19/2011 | REVIEW AGREEMENTS WITH THE OPEN GROUP (.5); FOLLOW UP WITH K. HUTCHENS AND S. TARR REGARDING POST-CLOSING ITEMS (.7) | 01761 | Lisa M. Casey Spaniel | 1.20 | 516.00 |
| 4/19/2011 | REVIEW EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE FROM K. HITCHENS REGARDING ASSIGNMENT OF INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY AGREEMENTS(0.1); OFFICE CONFERENCE WITH L. CASEY AND K. HITCHENS REGARDING SAME (.2) | 02482 | Jennifer L. Stefanski | 0.30 | 91.50 |
| 4/19/2011 | REVIEW OF NOTICES AND EMAIL L. CASEY REGARDING SAME (1.0) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.00 | 425.00 |
| 4/20/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING POST-CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/20/2011 | TEAM CALL REGARDING POST-CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.00 | 710.00 |
| 4/20/2011 | EMAIL REGARDING D&O INSURANCE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |

Info-Only Proforma Time Detail Report

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|-----------|--|------------|------------------|-------|----------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/20/2011 | REVIEW AND EDIT LETTER TO EMPLOYEES AND EMAIL REGARDING 401K | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/20/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH S. TARR ON DETAILS FOR CORPORATE NAME CHANGE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/20/2011 | PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING POST-CLOSING MATTERS | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 1.30 | 552.50 |
| 4/21/2011 | REVISE FORM LETTER TO SETTLE CURE CLAIMS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/21/2011 | REVIEW AND REVISE IC AGREEMENTS; EMAILS REGARDING SAME | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/21/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING 401K WIND DOWN | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/21/2011 | EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING COLLECTION OF A/R FROM MICROSOFT | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/21/2011 | REVIEW DRAFT CURE DOCUMENT (0.3) | 02655 | Stanley B. Tarr | 0.30 | 127.50 |
| 4/22/2011 | REVIEW EMAIL AND CERTIFICATION REGARDING SUSE ARBITRATION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/22/2011 | RESEARCH ON OPTIONS FOR ESTATE WIND DOWN | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.60 | 426.00 |
| 4/22/2011 | EMAILS REGARDING POST-CLOSING MAIL | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.10 | 71.00 |
| 4/25/2011 | TELEPHONE B. COMER REGARDING POST CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/25/2011 | B. COMER REGARDING ACCOUNTS RECEIVABLE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/25/2011 | REVIEW FILE NOTES TO ASSESS CASE STATUES AND WIND DOWN OPTIONS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.60 | 1,136.00 |
| 4/25/2011 | REVIEW TRANSITION AGREEMENT; NOTES TO FILE AND TELEPHONE K. HITCHINS; REVIEW UNXIS POST CLOSING CHECK LIST | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.20 | 852.00 |
| 4/26/2011 | REVIEW COMMUNICATION WITH ICC ARBITRATION TRIBUNAL AND EMAIL WITH COUNSEL | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| 4/26/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING LITIGATION STATUS | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | REVIEW POST CLOSING MATERIALS; APA; TRANSITION AGREEMENT AND NOTES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.40 | 994.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING POST CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | REVIEW NOTES REGARDING R. TIBBITTS; CONTINUED SALE POST CLOSING | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |

Client: 133091 Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600 In Re The Sco Group, Inc.

Task: 11 Sale of Assets/Asset Purchase Agreements

| Date | Narrative | Timekeeper | | Hours | Value |
|---------------|---|------------|------------------|---------------|------------------|
| | | Number | Name | | |
| 4/27/2011 | TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING IC AGREEMENT AND LITIGATION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.50 | 355.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | REVIEW UPDATED POST CLOSING GRID TO PREPARE FOR TEAM CALL | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | WEEKLY TEAM CALL TO REVIEW POST CLOSING ISSUES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.20 | 852.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | REVIEW EMAILS AND NOTES REGARDING SVRX ROYALTIES | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.40 | 284.00 |
| 4/27/2011 | FINALIZE, SCAN AND EFILE AFFIDAVIT OF SERVICE REGARDING MEMORANDUM OPINION REGARDING SALE MOTION AND ORDER APPROVING THE SALE OF ALL DEBTORS SOFTWARE PRODUCT BUSINESS ASSETS | 02432 | Tamara L. Moody | 0.20 | 44.00 |
| 4/28/2011 | CONFERENCE WITH K. HITCHENS REGARDING POST CLOSING MATTERS | 01848 | Jane K. Storero | 0.30 | 196.50 |
| 4/29/2011 | REVIEW DEFAULT LETTER FROM E. NEIGER; DISCUSS WITH S. TARR AND B. COMER AND REPLY | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 1.00 | 710.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | REVIEW IC AGREEMENTS AND FORWARD TO TRUSTEE FOR SIGNATURE | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.20 | 142.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | PREP FOR FEE APPLICATION | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 2.00 | 1,420.00 |
| 4/29/2011 | FURTHER CORRESPONDENCE WITH E. NEIGER | 00020 | Bonnie G. Fatell | 0.30 | 213.00 |
| Total: | | | | 178.80 | 83,965.50 |
| Total: | | | | 178.80 | 83,965.50 |