## Exhibit A

		1	ly Billing	I.	ly Billing			
			through	1	6/1/12 to	Total Billed	Tota	•
Name of	Position of Applicant, Number of	5/31	/12	7/31	/12	Hours	Com	pensation
Professional	Years in that Position, Prior Relevant							
	Experience, Year Obtaining							
	License to Practice, Area of Expertise							
Bonnie G. Fatell	Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981,	\$	730.00	\$	765.00	7.90	\$	5,851.00
	Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise -			1				
	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy							
	Partner Since 2010, Member of DE Bar Since 1998,							
	Member of PA Bar Since 1998, Area of Expertise -			-				
Carickhoff, D.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$	490.00				\$	
	Partner Since 2001, Member of DE Since 1993,							
	Member of PA Since 1994, Area of Expertise -							
Debaecke, M.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$	595.00				\$	
	Partner Since 2001, Member of PA Bar Since 1992,							
	Member of NJ Bar Since 1992, Area of Expertise -							
Schaedle, M.	Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$	570.00	\$	600.00	0.30	\$_	171.00
	Associate, Member of DE Bar Since 2010							
Root, A.	Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$	295.00	\$	310.00	0.20	\$	62.00
	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005,							
	Member of PA and DE Bars Since 2010							
Tarr, S.	Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$	450.00	\$	475,00	16.70	\$	7,645.00
Moody, T.	Paralegal	\$	230.00	\$	245.00	17.60	\$	4,166.50
Senese, K.	Paralegal	\$	260,00					
Grand Total						42.70	\$	17,895.50
Blended Rate								

PROJECT	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
CODE			
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters		
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	14,70	\$3,580.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	3,50	\$1,317.50
4	Debtors' Business Operations	23.50	\$12,753.00
5	Case Administration	1.00	\$245.00
. 6	IP Litigation		
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases		
8	Claims Analysis and Objections		
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor		
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement		
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement		
12	Stay Relief Issues		
13	Tax Issues		
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery		
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation		
16	Non-Working Travel		
	TOTALS	42.70	\$ <b>17</b> ,895.50

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

In Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 02

Blank Rome Fee/Employment Applications

Date: Narrative	Timekee Number		Hours	Value
Date Narrative 4/30/2012 ATTENTION TO FEE APPS	02432	Tamara L. Moody	1.30	299.00
5/16/2012 RESEARCH AND PREPARE FEE APPLICATIONS	02432	Tamara L. Moody	1.30	299.00
5/17/2012 EDIT PROFORMAS	02432	Tamara L. Moody	1.70	391.00
5/17/2012 RESEARCH, REVIEW, PREPARE EXHIBITS AND DRAFT FEE APPLICATIONS	02432.	Tamara L. Moody	1.50) 	345,00
5/29/2012 PREPARE AND REVISE 28TH AND 29TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION PAPERS	02432	Tamara L. Moody	2.20	506.00
5/29/2012 PREPARE AND REVISE 27TH MONTHLY FEE APPLICATION	02432	Tamara L. Moody.	1.10	253.00
6/6/2012 EDIT AND REVISE FEE APPLICATIONS	02432	Tamara L. Moody	4.10	1,004.50
6/7/2012 REVISE AND RREPARE FEE APPLICATIONS	02432	Tamara Li, Moody	1.00	245.00
6/8/2012 EMAILS REGARDING FEE APPLICATIONS	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0,30	142.50
6/11/2012 EMAIL OPA REGARDING FEES	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.20	95,00
自然是是是是是是不是不是一个,但是不是一个,但是是一个,但是是一个,但是是一个,但是是一个,也是是一个,但是一个,也是一个,也是一个,也是一个,也是一个,也是一	11994498418101190119011910172	######################################	14.70	3,580.00

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

In Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 03

Other Professionals' Fee/Employment issues

7/12/2012 EFILE OPA'S MONTHLY APPLICATION FOR JANUARY 02432 Tamara L. Moody 1.50 36 THRU APRIL 2012; COORDINATE SERVICE OF SAME	7.50
	7.00
AND 31ST (0.5) MONTHLY FEE APPLICATIONS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME	0.00 7.50

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

In Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 04

Debtors' Business Operations

	Timekeej	oer		
Date Narrative 4/10/2012 EMAIL TRUSTEE REGARDING EXECUTION OF IC	Number 02655	Name Stanley B. Tarr	Hours 0.30	Value 135.00
AGREEMENT AND REVIEW OF SAME (0.3)	escare v mieritata.	Anna Anna Anna Anna Anna Anna Anna Anna	kerena menakaken karetaken kere	The second was a second with the second seco
4/11/2012 EMAIL FULLY-EXEGUTED IC AGREEMENT 4/17/2012 EMAIL B. FATELL, TRUSTEE, R. TIBBITTS REGARDING	02655 02655	Stanley B. Tarr Stanley B. Tarr	0.20	90.00
4/17/2012 EMAIL B. FATELL, TROSTEE, R. TIBBITTS REGARDING 4/18 CALL (0.2)	UZUUU			<b>医性原理的连续检查和检查</b> 计
4/18/2012 TELECON W TRUSTEE, R TIBBITS AND TARR.	00020 02655	Bonnie G. Fatell Stanley B. Tarr	0.50 1.50	365,00 675.00
4/18/2012 EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING CASE STATUS (0.3); MARK-UP OF IC AGREEMENT AND EMAIL OPA REGARDING SAME (0.4); ATTEND CALL WITH TRUSTEE, R. TIBBITTS, B. FATELL AND FOLLOW-UP EMAIL REGARDING SAME (0.8)		Stanley B. Tan	1100	0,000
4/19/2012 EMAILS WITH IC AND OPA (0.3)	-02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.30	135,00
4/24/2012 MEETING WITH S. TARR AND TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH T. NORMAND	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.40	292.00
4/24/2012 CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING CASE STATUS  AND CALL WITH BSF REGARDING SAME	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.60	270.00
4/25/2012 EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING STATUS, FILINGS	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.40	180.00
4/26/2012 REVIEW MORS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILLING AND SERVICE OF SAME (0.4);	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.70	315.00
EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING CASE STATUS (0.3)				
4/27/2012 EFILE MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS FOR JANUARY 2012	02432	Tamara L. Moody	0.20	46.00
4/30/2012 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING WIND DOWN ISSUES	00020	Bonnië G. Fatell	0.50	365,00
4/30/2012 REVIEW REPORT FROM R. TIBBITTS ON IBM	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.80	584.00
LITIGATION (.1); TELEPHONE TRUSTEE TO DISCUSS WIND DOWN (.2); TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH				
BOISE SCHILLER TEAM AND TRUSTEE (.5)			0.20	90,00
4/30/2012 RÉVIEW B. FATELL EMAIL REGARDING CASE STATUS (0.1); EMAIL OPA REGARDING STATUS (0.1)	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	U.2V	
5/1/2012 REVIEW K&M LETTER AND EMAIL OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.3); ATTEND TO EXECUTION OF K	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.60	270.00
AGREEMENT (0.3)	partovari se ili rampaissi	(2)台中在建筑新疆设置过度将至37;自在建筑设置是原列营营		60600
5/4/2012 REVIEW AMENDED LOAN AGREEMENT AND NOTE FOR EVENTS OF DEFAULT AND DISCUSS WIND DOWN WITH	₹ 00020 H	Bonnie G. Fatell	0/50	365.00
SI TARR	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.30	135.00
5/7/2012 EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING MOR AND BUDGET 5/9/2012 TELEPHONE/CONFERENCE WITH H. VACKSON	02000	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.30	219.00
REGARDING STATUS OF CASE AND DISCUSSED LENDER OPPORTUNITIES.				
5/14/2012 REVIEW K. NEILSON'S EMAIL REGARDING SCO JAPAN	; 00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0,40	292.00
401K STATUS REPORT AND MEETING WITH S. TARR 5//14/2012: REVIEW, CONSIDER AND RESPOND TO K. NIEUSEN	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	1.10	495,00
EMAIL (0,4); CONFER WITH B; FATELL REGARDING UPDATE:(0,8); REVIEW OPA EMAIL REGARDING K&M				
(0.2)) REVIEW 401K UPDATE (0.2)				
·				

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

In Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 04

Debtors' Business Operations

	Timekeer	PROMEEN A 1950年 基础		
Date  5/15/2012 EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND MEETING WITH S.  TARR REGARDING WIND DOWN	Number 00020	Name Bonnie G. Fatell	Hours 0,20	<b>Value</b> 146.00
5/15/2012 MONITOR EMAILS REGARDING K, NEILSON RESIGNATION AS BOARD MEMBER	00020	Bonnie G., Fatell	0.10	73.00
5/15/2012 EMAILS WITH BSF REGARDING STATUS (0.2); EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING CALL SCHEDULING (0.2); ATTENTION TO POWER OF ATTORNEY MATTER (0.4); EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING NOVELL ISSUE (0.3); ATTENTION TO K. NIELSEN ISSUES (0.5)	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	1.40	630.00
5/16/2012 CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. COMER AND S. TARR REGARDING WIND DOWN	00020	Bonnle G. Fatell	0.40	292.00 360.00
5/16/2012 CALL WITH OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING CASE STATUS AND REVIEW PREPARATION DOCS REGARDING SAME	02655	Stanley B. Tarr		OU.UU
5/17/2012 EMAIL TO B, COMER REGARDING CONVERSION 5/17/2012 DISCUSS TRANSITION TO CHAPTER 7; REVIEW ORDER IN OTHER CASES	00020 00020	Bonnie G. Fatell Bonnie G. Fatell	0,20 0.40	146.00 292.00
5/17/2012 DISCUSS CONVERSION OPTIONS WITH B. FATELL	01721	Michael B. Schaedle	0.30	171.00
5/17/2012 EMAILS WITH UST 5/18/2012 FINALIZE, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATING	02655 02432	Stanley B. Tarr Tamara L. Moody	0.30	135.00 92.00
REPORTS UPON US TRUSTEE			0.70	215.00
5/18/2012 REVIEW MORS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING (0.4); EMAILS WITH UST (0.3)	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.70	315.00
5/22/2012 DISCUSS WIND DOWN WITH S. TARR AND J. SARKESSIAN REGARDING SAME	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.40	292.00
5/22/2012 EMAILS WITH K. NIELSEN REGARDING JAPAN ISSUE (0.4); ATTENTION TO HEIRFINDERS MATTER (0.3)	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.70	315.00
5/23/2012 REVIEW K. NIELSEN EMAILS	02655	Stanley By Tarr	,0130	135.00
5/25/2012 EMAILS REGARDING POSSIBLE ADDITIONAL FUNDING 5/25/2012 REVIEW OPA, L'ENDERS, SOO JAPAN EMAILS	00020 02655	Bonnie G. Fatell Stanley B. Tarr	0.20 0.40	146.00 180.00
5/30/2012 EMAIL RE FINANCING	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.20	146.00
5/30/2012 REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING LENDERS	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.30	135.00
5/31/2012 EMAIL R. TIBBITTS REGARDING IBM ORDER	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.20 0.20	90,00 153,00
6/6/2012 EMAIL RE NEW LOAN AND WIND DOWN, MONITOR EMAILS RE WIND DOWN OF 401K	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	U(20 Vita (1)	193,00
6/14/2012 REVIEW MOTION FOR BRIEFING IN IBM	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.20	153.00
6/14/2012 REVIEW BSF DOCUMENT AND COMMENT THERETO: 6/19/2012 REVIEW MORS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME (0.3); EMAIL S WITCH UST REGARDING SAME (0,2)	02655    02655	Stanley B. Tarr Stanley B. Tarr	0.50 0.50	142.50 237.50
6/20/2012 TELERHONE CONFERENCE WITH SUTARR 6/20/2012 CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING STATUS AND EMAIL R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SAME	00020 02655	Bonnie G. Fatell Stanley B. Tarr	0.10\ 0.30	76.50 142.50
6/29/2012 FINÁLIZE, EFILE AND SERVE MONTHLY OPERATION REPORTS FOR APRIL 2012	02432	Tamara L. Moody	0:30	73,50

8/15/2012 8:34 4 of 6

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

in Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 04

Debtors' Business Operations

Date Narrative	Timekee Number	per Name	Hours	Value
6/29/2012 REVIEW MORS AND INSTRUCT PARALEGAL REGARDING FILING AND SERVICE OF SAME (0.3); EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING MORS (0.2)	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.50	237.50
7/11/2012 EMAILS REGARDING REQUEST FOR MOR INFO	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.20	95,00
7/17/2012 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING STATUS AND BUDGET, EMAIL BORSE SCHILLER REGARDING IBM LITIGATION	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.40	306.00
7/17/2012 EMAIL RESPONSES TO OPA	02655	Stanley B. Tair,	0.40	190,00
7/24/2012 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. LOEB REGARDING STATUS OF CASE	i 00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.30	229.50
7/25/2012 TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH UST	00020	Bonnië G. Fatell	0:40	306,00
7/26/2012 B. FATELL EMAILS REGARDING CONVERSION	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.20	95,00
7/30/2012 MEET WITH S. TARR REGARDING CONVERSION	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.40	306,00
7/31/2012 EMAIL TO UST; EMAIL TO LENDER	00020	Bonnie G. Fatell	0.40	306.00
7/31/2012 RESEARCH AND OBTAIN FORM MOTION TO CONVERT CASE, EMAIL SAME TO S. TARR	02622	Alan M. Root	0.20	62,00
7/31/2012 CALL CHAMBERS REGARDING HEARING DATE AND DISCUSS CONVERSION MOTION WITH A. ROOT	02655	Stanley B. Tarr	0.30	142.50
Total:			23.50	12,753.00

Cahn, Edward N., Chapter 11 Trustee

Matter: 133091-01600

In Re The SCO Group, Inc.

Task: 05

Case Administration

	keeper oer Name	Hours	Value
6/18/2012 RESEARCH AND REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS 0243. AND PLEADINGS	2 Tamara L. Moody	0.40	98.00
7/3/2012 REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS 1.0248	2 Tamara L. Moody	0,10	24,50
7/16/2012 ATTENTION TO FILING 0243	2 Tamara L. Moody	0.30	73.50
7/31/2012: REVIEW UPDATED DOCKET SHEETS AND PLEADINGS; 0243	2 Tamara L. Moody	0.20	49.00
Total:		1.00	245.00
Total:		42.70	17,895.50
Total:		42.70	17,895.50